TAX COLLECTOR ROY GIVEN, CPA

DIVISION OF THEDEPARTMENT OF FINANCE  DiRECTOR OF FINANCE

COUNTY OF MARIN

MiNA MARTINOVICH, CPA, ASSISTANT
SANDRA KACHARDS, DIVISION CHIEF

FISCAL
ASSESSOR'S YEAR OF | DEFAULT MINIMUM
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October 21, 2021 Sealed Bid Tax Sale - Final Report

Initial Offering
1 048-232-63 2007 15852 |OTTERLEE JAMES A & $85,000.00 No Bid
OTTERLEE MARGARET
2 048-232-65 2007 15853 |OTTERLEE JAMES A & $68,700.00 No Bid
OTTERLEE MARGARET
3 157-122-36 2010 23294 |SCOZZAFAVA JOHN & $36,200.00 $36,463 85
SCOZZAFAVA MARIANNE
4 172-332-06 2009 21531 |SAN GERONIMO VAL PLANNING GROUP $23,400.00 No Bid

5 192-201-20 2011 23900 |CHU CLARENCE $18,300.00 $32,300 00
SABA MARWAN Y

Previously Offered
6 043-282-15 2003 9467 TAYLOR STANLEY W & ISABELLE D $4,000.00 $15,000 00

7&8 Combination Sale: $40,000.00 No Bid
045-142-10 2006 14038 KUBBY CAROL A

ROBERTS REXM &

ROBERTS RITA L

MOORE JENNIFER &

MOORE RUSSELL

ROSENBLATT FAMILY TRUST 1993

ROSENBLATT MARTIN, TRUSTEE

ROSENBLATT JANE B, TRUSTEE

FINN JOCELYN V

REINHARDT JULIE A SEPARATE PROPERTY TRUST
REINHARDT JULIE A, TRUSTEE

REINHARDT FAMILY TRUST 1995

REINHARDT GENE A, TRUSTEE

REINHARDT JULIE A, TRUSTEE

045-142-11 2006 14039 KUBBY CAROL A

ROBERTS REXM &

ROBERTS RITA L

MOORE JENNIFER &

MOORE RUSSELL

ROSENBLATT FAMILY TRUST 1993

ROSENBLATT MARTIN, TRUSTEE

ROSENBLATT JANE B, TRUSTEE

FINN JOCELYN V

REINHARDT JULIE A SEPARATE PROPERTY TRUST
REINHARDT JULIE A, TRUSTEE

REINHARDT FAMILY TRUST 1995

REINHARDT GENE A TRUSTEE

9 045-211-10 2006 14045 |SPIELBAUER DENNIS $20,700.00 Redeemed

10 047-021-32 2009 20227 |SUMMERFIELD DEV CO INC $3,800.00 $3,805.00

11 048-082-21 2009 20249 |HYNES GERRY $23,300.00 $23,300 00

12 048-202-12 2011 24613  YESHIVA DVAR YESHORIM dba D'VAR INSTITUTE $23,500.00 $62,930.70
KIRZNER FAMILY 1990 TRUST
KIRZNER LEONID, TRUSTEE
KIRZNER CLARA, TRUSTEE

13& 14 Combination Sale: $47,500.00 No Bid
048-202-13 2011 24614  YESHIVA DVAR YESHORIM dba D'VAR INSTITUTE
KIRZNER FAMILY 1990 TRUST

KIRZNER LEONID, TRUSTEE

KIRZNER CLARA, TRUSTEE

048-202-24 2011 24615 MAHABIR MAREN | EST OF

KIRZNER FAMIILY 1990 TRUST

KIRZNER LEONID, TRUSTEE EST OF &

KIRZNER CLARA, TRUSTEE

15,16 & 17 Combination Sale: $81,300.00 No Bid
049-012-03 2005 12542  [SHAIX LTD
049-012-04 2005 12543  [REAL PROGRESS LLC
049-012-05 2005 12544  [REAL PROGRESS LLC
18,19 & 20 Combination Sale: $83,300.00 No Bid
049-012-61 2007 15854 [CHENG TONY
049-012-62 2007 15855 [CHENG TONY
049-012-63 2007 15856 [CHENG TONY
21,22 &23 Combination Sale: $66,300.00 No Bid
049-012-64 2009 20262 |MILL VALLEY TAMALPAIS LAND TRUST
049-012-65 2009 20263  |MILL VALLEY TAMALPAIS LAND TRUST
049-012-66 2009 20264 |MILL VALLEY TAMALPAIS LAND TRUST
24 114-212-12 2009 20643 |MARIN CO ABSTRACT & TITLE CO $5,700.00 No Bid
25 114-212-21 2009 20644 |VACHA EDWARD J & LORETTAE $5,700.00 No Bid
BIGGS WILLIAM A & EUNICE M
26 172-241-42 2009 21521 |SAN GERONIMO VAL PLANNING GROUP $12,800.00 No Bid
27 172-241-44 2009 21522 |SAN GERONIMO VAL PLANNING GROUP $12,800.00 No Bid
28,29 & 30 Combination Sale: $62,100.00 No Bid
172-252-08 2005 13080 [COXJH
172-252-09 2005 13081 [COX HAL
172-252-31 2005 13082 [COXJOSEPH H
31&32 Combination Sale: $37,500.00 No Bid
172-252-18 2005 13082 |COXJHAL
172-252-19 2005 13083 |SHAIXLTD
33 180-281-11 2009 21719 |ROSENBERG DAVID J & ELAINE $8,800.00 No Bid
34 &35 Combination Sale: $26,300.00 $50,020 00
190-231-06 2006 14892 HEFFERNAN FRANCES J
190-231-07 2007 16895 FRANCES J HEFFERNAN REVOCABLE TRUST

FRANCES J HEFFERNAN, TRUSTEE

Requests for accommodations may be made by calling (415) 473-4381 (Voice/TTY), 711 for California Relay Service or
by e-mail at disabilityaccess@marincounty.org. Copies of documents are available in alternative formats, upon receipt.



