TAX COLLECTOR

ROY GIVEN, CPA
DIVISION OF THEDEPARTMENT OF FINANCE  DIRECTOR OF FINANCE
COUNTY OF MARIN
2017 PUBLIC AUCTION LIST
Previously Offered Parcels
FISCAL
ITEM ASSESSOR'S YEAR OF | DEFAULT MINIMUM Sold For
NO. PARCEL NO. DEFAULT NO. LAST ASSESSEE BID
3386 001-191-16 2005 12063 |COX JOSEPH H $31,200.00 No Bid
3387 003-052-20 2008 17246 |PHAM CHAU N $50,400.00 No Bid
3391 013-310-27 2008 17533 |SHIEL TONY $9,400.00 No Bid
3394 039-012-14 2008 17816 |QUAN PATRICIA A $7,100.00 No Bid
3398 047-083-14 2007 15836 |COOPERSMITH JOEL $30,000.00 No Bid
Combination Sale:
3399 049-012-03 2005 12542 |SHAIX LTD .
3400 049-012-04 2005 | 12543 |REAL PROGRESSLLC 2080000 N Ge
3401 049-012-05 2005 12544 |REAL PROGRESS LLC
Combination Sale:
3402 049-012-61 2007 15854 |CHENG TONY .
3403 049-012-62 2007 15855 |CHENG TONY SRLE0000 NoEE
3404 049-012-63 2007 15856 |CHENG TONY
3408 059-151-34 1998 892 VELLA SAM $26,500.00 No Bid
3412 132-132-16 2006 14368 |HANSEN NIELSA TR & $7,900.00 No Bid
HANSEN DOROTHY L TR
3415 153-162-40 2008 18600 |FLORES MARGARITA $7,600.00 No Bid
3416 155-161-20 2008 18617 |KKG CONSOLIDATED LLC $19,200.00 No Bid
3424 169-041-30 2006 14747 |TETREAULT JOYCE L EST OF $23,500.00 No Bid
3427 169-241-05 2003 10179 |PENNER OMAR A & ESTATE OF $41,500.00 No Bid
PENNER EVELYN L ESTATE OF
3428 169-243-01 2003 10183 |PENNER OMAR A & ESTATE OF $52,300.00 No Bid
PENNER EVELYN L ESTATE OF
3429 169-321-10 2007 16684 |NELDER FAMILY TRUST $21,300.00 No Bid
3430 170-082-06 2007 16689 |TYSON KRISS R $15,200.00 No Bid
Combination Sale:
3431 172-252-08 2005 13080 [COXJH .
3432 172-252-09 2005 13081 |COX HAL B2.10000 NoEE
3435 172-252-31 2005 13085 |COX JOSEPH H
Combination Sale:
3433 172-252-18 2005 13082 |COX J HAL $46,400.00 No Bid
3434 172-252-19 2005 13083 |SHAIX LTD
3437 180-241-23 1998 1859 MC MAHAN DOROTHEA EST OF $17,300.00 No Bid
3438 180-333-05 2003 10301 [ISAAC TIMOTHY $93,400.00 No Bid
3442 190-191-18 2008 19050 |GRANGER WALTER B $11,700.00 No Bid
Combination Sale:
3443 190-231-06 2006 14892 |HEFFERNAN FRANCESJ $27,700.00 No Bid
3444 190-231-07 2007 16895 |HEFFERNAN FRANCES J TR
3445 191-022-04 2005 13214 |LIGHTFOOT LELAND B EST OF & $18,500.00 $18,500.00
LIGHTFOOT LYNN E EST OF
3447 191-241-24 2003 10346 |YIM TUNG $22,100.00 $22,100.00
3450 200-200-18 2008 19119 |QUAN PATRICIA A $2,700.00 No Bid
First Time Offered
FISCAL
ITEM ASSESSOR'S YEAR OF | DEFAULT MINIMUM SOLD FOR
NO. PARCEL NO. DEFAULT NO. LAST ASSESSEE BID
3451 001-142-15 2008 17213 |ESTALITA EDWARD L $20,000.00 $20,000.00
3453 005-165-46 2011 24039 ([SIEBOLD SALLY A $1,200.00 No Bid
3454 005-165-48 2011 24040 ([SIEBOLD SALLY A $1,200.00 No Bid
3455 005-165-50 2011 24041 |REGAN EDWARD W $1,300.00 $1,300.00
3457 005-300-05 2008 17297 |GONSALVES RONALD A $12,500.00 No Bid
3460 006-201-42 2011 24081 [BLUE PACIFIC ESTATES LTD $1,200.00 $1,200.00
3461 007-032-09 2011 24094 [MALIK SHUJAULLAH $321,000.00 No Bid
3462 007-032-32 2011 24096 |QUINN JAMES G & $1,200.00 .
QUINN MARSHA No Bid
3463 010-041-05 2011 24154 [NICHOLS BARBARAJ $1,500.00 Cancelled
3464 010-241-47 2009 19626 |LA CORTE NORA $7,200.00 No Bid
3465 010-301-19 2009 19637 |[MILICEVICH MARIE G $7,000.00 No Bid
3466 010-321-20 2009 19638 |TISS JACQUELINE G $7,100.00 No Bid

Requests for accommodations may be made by calling (415) 473-4381 (Voice/TTY), 711 for California Relay
Service or by e-mail at disabilityaccess@marincounty.org. Copies of documents are available in alternative

formats, upon request.
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3468

016-161-39

2009

19836

WALSH J & BARBARA
MORRIS KENNETH & LESLEY

$7,200.00

No Bid

3473

023-080-08

2009

19946

RICCI EUGENE R

$2,800.00

$3,100.00

3475

025-012-15

2011

24401

KELLER GERALDINE

$3,800.00

No Bid

3476

026-061-05

2009

20000

RICCI EUGENE R

$14,700.00

$14,700.00

3477

030-260-06

2009

20101

SINGER MARIETTA EST OF
ZARO NICHOLAS EST OF

$22,100.00

No Bid

3478

043-282-15

2003

9467

TAYLOR STANLEY W & ISABELLE D

$3,000.00

No Bid

3480

045-142-10

2006

14038

ROBERTS, REX M & ROBERTS, RITAL

MOORE, JENNIFER & MOORE, RUSSELL

ROSENBLATT FAMILY TRUST DATED FEBRUARY 7, 1993
ROSENBLATT, MARTIN & ROSENBLATT, JANE B TRUSTEES

FINN, JOCELYN V

JULIE A REINHARDT SEPARATE PROPERTY TRUST, DATED JANUARY
26, 1995

REINHARDT FAMILY TRUST DATED JANUARY 26, 1995

REINHARDT, GENE A & REINHARDT, JULIE A TRUSTEES

KUBBY, CAROL A

$14,100.00

No Bid

3481

045-142-11

2006

14039

ROBERTS, REX M & ROBERTS, RITA L

MOORE, JENNIFER & MOORE, RUSSELL

ROSENBLATT FAMILY TRUST DATED FEBRUARY 7, 1993
ROSENBLATT, MARTIN & ROSENBLATT, JANE B TRUSTEES

FINN, JOCELYN V

JULIE A REINHARDT SEPARATE PROPERTY TRUST, DATED JANUARY
26, 1995

REINHARDT FAMILY TRUST DATED JANUARY 26, 1995

REINHARDT, GENE A & REINHARDT, JULIE A TRUSTEES

KUBBY, CAROL A

$31,200.00

No Bid

3482

045-142-12

2006

14040

ROBERTS, REX M & ROBERTS, RITA L

MOORE, JENNIFER & MOORE, RUSSELL

ROSENBLATT FAMILY TRUST DATED FEBRUARY 7, 1993
ROSENBLATT, MARTIN & ROSENBLATT, JANE B TRUSTEES

FINN, JOCELYN V

JULIE A REINHARDT SEPARATE PROPERTY TRUST, DATED JANUARY
26, 1995

REINHARDT FAMILY TRUST DATED JANUARY 26, 1995

REINHARDT, GENE A & REINHARDT, JULIE A TRUSTEES

KUBBY, CAROL A

$29,700.00

$29,700.00

3483

045-261-02

2009

20218

HALLSTAN SEGURD G

$3,000.00

No Bid

3484

046-132-05

2009

20222

HALLSTAN SEGURD G

$2,700.00

$4,000.00

3485

047-021-32

2009

20227

SUMMERFIELD DEV CO INC

$2,200.00

No Bid

3486

048-081-15

2009

20247

HYNES GERRY

$38,000.00

$38,000.00

3487

048-082-21

2009

20249

HYNES GERRY

$23,000.00

No Bid

3488

048-202-12

2011

24613

LIPOVETSKY FAMILY 1990 TRUST

LIPOVETSKY EUGENE & LIPOVETSKY ADEL TRUSTEES
KIRZNER FAMILY 1990 TRUST

KIRZNER LEONID & KIRZNER CLARA TRUSTEES

$21,900.00

No Bid

3489

048-202-13

2011

24614

LIPOVETSKY FAMILY 1990 TRUST

LIPOVETSKY EUGENE & LIPOVETSKY ADEL TRUSTEES
KIRZNER FAMILY 1990 TRUST

KIRZNER LEONID & KIRZNER CLARA TRUSTEES

$21,900.00

No Bid

3490

048-202-24

2011

24615

MAHABIR MAREN |
KIRZNER FAMILY 1990 TRUST
KIRZNER LEONID & KIRZNER CLARA TRUSTEES

$21,900.00

No Bid

3491

048-202-26

2011

24616

MAHABIR MAREN |
KIRZNER FAMILY 1990 TRUST
KIRZNER LEONID & KIRZNER CLARA TRUSTEES

$21,900.00

$21,900.00

3492

048-232-67

2009

19278

LESKO KENNETH V

$38,700.00

No Bid

3493

049-012-64

2009

20262

MILL VALLEY TAMALPAIS LAND TRUST

$21,800.00

No Bid

3494

049-012-65

2009

20263

MILL VALLEY TAMALPAIS LAND TRUST

$21,800.00

No Bid

3495

049-012-66

2009

20264

MILL VALLEY TAMALPAIS LAND TRUST

$21,800.00

No Bid

3496

065-261-28

2011

24774

NIEVERGELT PETER

$3,900.00

$3,900.00

3498

075-151-67

2008

18105

KIRKPATRICK VIRGINIA

$26,400.00

No Bid

3499

075-151-68

2008

18106

KIRKPATRICK VIRGINIA

$26,400.00

No Bid

3500

100-291-16

2008

18116

JORDAN FAMILY LTD PARTNERSHIP IV

$3,600.00

No Bid

3502

114-130-27

2007

16105

MARSHALL ANDREW

$10,600.00

$10,600.00

3503

114-201-08

2008

18161

BARRERA LISA H

$6,400.00

No Bid

3504

114-212-12

2009

20643

MARIN CO ABSTRACT & TITLE CO

$5,100.00

No Bid
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3505 114-212-21 2009 20644 |VACHA EDWARD J & LORETTA E $5,100.00 No Bid
BIGGS WILLIAM A & EUNICE M
3507 140-191-48 2009 20821 |WILSON GEORGE L & $1,900.00 No Bid
WILSON BARBARA E
3508 141-051-17 2011 25022 |GUDGEL RICHARD S & $1,700.00 $1,700.00
GUDGEL SANDRA E
3509 141-051-18 2011 25023 |GUDGEL RICHARD S & $1,700.00 No Bid
GUDGEL SANDRA E
3510 141-051-19 2011 25024 |GUDGEL RICHARD S & $1,800.00 $1,800.00
GUDGEL SANDRA E
3512 146-371-20 2009 20979 |JONES STEPHEN K & PAMELA $1,900.00 No Bid
3513 150-221-15 2009 20985 |LEE WINIFRED $1,900.00 No Bid
3514 150-221-17 2009 20986 |LEE WINIFRED $1,900.00 No Bid
3515 150-225-08 2009 20988 |LEE WINIFRED $1,900.00 $1,900.00
3516 150-225-10 2009 20989 |LEE WINIFRED $1,900.00 $1,900.00
3517 150-225-12 2009 20990 |LEE WINIFRED $1,900.00 No Bid
3518 150-225-14 2009 20991 |LEE WINIFRED $1,900.00 No Bid
3519 152-013-07 2009 21049 |LIT PETER $1,900.00 $1,900.00
LIT C MAYA EST OF
3525 157-123-05 2006 14560 |NERSESIAN TOM T & HELEN L $8,100.00 No Bid
3527 160-642-11 2009 21319 |HILLSIDE PARK PARTNERS $2,100.00 No Bid
3553 164-471-59 2009 21409 |SECURITY SAVINGS & LOAN ASSN $4,200.00 No Bid
3555 169-241-11 2009 21482 |HOECKELE HAROLD $12,900.00 No Bid
3556 169-242-32 2008 18857 |NIELSEN JOHN F JR & EVELYN G $14,500.00 No Bid
3557 170-072-07 2007 16686 |ACMIS TWENTY FIVE LLC $23,900.00 No Bid
3558 170-072-08 2007 16687 |ACMIS TWENTY FIVE LLC $20,900.00 No Bid
3559 172-241-42 2009 21521 |SAN GERONIMO VAL PLANNING GROUP $11,900.00 No Bid
3560 172-241-44 2009 21522 |SAN GERONIMO VAL PLANNING GROUP $11,900.00 No Bid
3562 174-111-75 2011 25436 |GREIG JACK R & ANN M $1,300.00 No Bid
3563 175-292-39 2002 8563 |PETERSON LELAND J $11,200.00 $11,200.00
3565 180-281-11 2009 21719 |ROSENBERG DAVID J & ELAINE $8,600.00 No Bid
3566 190-011-20 2009 21786 |NRLLEASTLLC $13,500.00 $13,500.00
3567 190-061-08 2009 21789 |STAL MARK $12,200.00 No Bid
3568 190-072-14 2009 21790 |DARK BRUCE M $11,800.00 No Bid
3569 190-221-01 2011 25602 |DETWEILER NICHOLAS $11,800.00 $11,800.00
3570 190-231-02 2009 21798 |NEW SONIA U $13,000.00 No Bid
3571 191-021-20 2009 21800 |DEWORKEN JOHN $14,400.00 No Bid
3572 191-061-10 2011 25607 |HANSON GARY F $8,200.00 $8,200.00
3573 191-111-01 2009 21806 |BARNES JACK $12,500.00 No Bid
3574 191-111-11 2009 21807 |BOONE THOMAS E $10,400.00 No Bid
ANDREW MARION B
3575 191-122-06 2009 21810 |AXELROD ETHEL $10,400.00 $10,400.00
3576 192-042-20 2009 21818 |TACHERRA ERNEST J $12,200.00 $12,200.00
3577 192-061-01 2011 25615 |HABER ARLENE $9,500.00 $9,500.00
3578 192-112-08 2009 21823 |ANSARI HOOSHANG $13,500.00 No Bid
3579 192-131-14 2009 19245 |ESPOSITO ROSE EST OF $13,400.00 $14,200.00
3580 192-171-24 2009 21836 |CISSNA ROBERT LEE $10,500.00 $10,500.00
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