12020085~

COUNTY OF MARIN ™

COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT AGENCY

CONTRACTOR’S Residential REROOF PERMIT APPLICATION

with Electronic Inspection ca Heaith and Safety Code Section 19825

V 6-14-12 3p2s H:\2012 Permit Masters\v 6-14-12 E-Inspection Reroof application. dotx

Permit #

#1 IDENTIFY YOUR REROOF PROJECT

Issued Date:

What is it you will be doing? Please indicate ALL work to be performed under this reroof permit:

Type of building Scope of work
[1 Single-family Res L] Tear off
[1 Duplex Res [ Re-sheet

[0 Townhouse Res [J Overlay (of 1 layer max)

1 Accessory building L1 Increase slope

Existing roofing material

Existing roof slope

Reroofing material Energy features

[J Comp shingle
[1 Sheet metal

[ Cool roof req'd

1 Wood LI Cool roof exempt
L1 Tile / slate
1 Hot-mop 1 Above-deck insul

1 Membrane

[1Other Describe:

NOTE: Class A roof is required when more than 50% of the existing roofing is replaced

How much is this project going to cost? TOTAL contract amount or dollar value of all work to be performed under this

permit:

Project Location

Address of Project

City, State, Zip

Locality

Nearest Cross Street

Assessor Parcel Number

Number of Units

Property Owner Contact Information:

Property Owner Information

Telephone

3501 Civic Center Drive - Suite 308 - San Rafael, CA 94903-4157 - 415 473 6550 T- 415 473 7432 F - 415 473 2255 TTY - www.marincounty.org/bldg



PG.20F 4

Mailing Address

City, State, Zip Email

#2 IDENTIFY WHO WILL PERFORM THE WORK, WORKERS’ COMPENSTATION COVERAGE AND
LENDING AGENCY

This permit is to be issued in the name of the Licensed Contractor as the permit holder of record who will be
responsible and liable for the construction and all inspection requirements.

CALIFORNIA LICENSED CONTRACTOR'S DECLARATION
| hereby affirm under penalty of perjury that | am licensed under provisions of Chapter 9 (commencing with Section 7000) of
Division 3 of the Business and Professions Code, and my license is in full force and effect.

Contractor Name: Telephone Number

Mailing Address:

City, State, Zip: Email Address:

License Class and No. Contractor Signature

WARNING: FAILURE TO SECURE WORKERS’ COMPENSATION COVERAGE IS UNLAWFUL, AND SHALL
SUBJECT AN EMPLOYER TO CRIMINAL PENALTIES AND CIVIL FINES UP TO ONE HUNDRED THOUSAND
DOLLARS ($100,000), IN ADDITION TO THE COST OF COMPENSATION, DAMAGES AS PROVIDED FOR IN

SECTION 3706 OF THE LABOR CODE, INTEREST, AND ATTORNEY’S FEES.

WORKERS' COMPENSATION DECLARATION
| hereby affirm under penalty of perjury the following declarations:

() I have and will maintain workers’ compensation insurance, as required by Section 3700 of the Labor Code, for the
performance of the work for which this permit is issued. My workers’ compensation insurance carrier and policy number
are:

Carrier. Policy No Expiration Date

Name of Agent Tel No

DECLARATION REGARDING CONSTRUCTION LENDING AGENCY
| hereby affirm under penalty of perjury that there is a construction lending agency for the performance of the work for
which this permit is issued (Section 3097, Civil Code).

Lender's Name and Address

3501 Civic Center Drive - Suite 308 - San Rafael, CA 94903-4157 - 415 473 6550 T - 415 473 7432 F - 415 473 2255 TTY - www.marincounty.org/bldg



PG. 3 OF 4

#3 CONFIRMATIONS BY CONTRACTOR IN ACCEPTANCE OF THE TERMS AND RESPONSIBILITIES
ASSUMED UNDER THIS PERMIT APPLICATION

| hereby affirm under penalty of perjury by my initials below, | certify to each of the following:

1. [ understand, as the California licensed contractor in whose name this permit may be issued and who will be
performing the work authorized by this permit, that | am solely responsible and liable for the quality of work performed
under this permit, and for knowing and complying with all applicable State laws, Marin County Code requirements and
manufacturer's specifications; and | agree to fulfill these aforementioned responsibilities.

2. | understand, as the California licensed contractor in whose name this permit may be issued, that [ am solely
responsible for satisfying all Electronic Inspection requirements and obtaining necessary Marin County approvals to
finalize and close this permit.

3. | understand and agree, as the permit applicant, that my application to this Electronic Inspection permit program
is elective and purely voluntary, and that | have the option to choose a traditional site-inspection permit application for this
proposed scope of work, but willingly choose to participate in this optional permit program. | further agree to fully
disclose the terms of this Electronic Inspection permit to the property owner indicated in this permit application.

4, i understand and agree that the Electronic Inspection permit issued as a result of this application, or any or all of
the permissions granted to me under this permit, may be denied, voided or revoked by the County of Marin on the basis of
incomplete or inaccurate information or my failure to demonstrate compliance with any of the specific requirements of this
permit. | further understand and agree that approvals necessary to issue and finalize this application and permit are not
guaranteed and are subject to review of information provided by me and my evidence of work performed in compliance
with the requirements of this permit.

5. In the event Marin County representatives desire to perform on-site inspection of work performed under this
permit, | authorize representatives of the County to enter the above-identified property for inspection purposes.

6. | understand failure on my part to observe or fulfill my obligations under this permit may result in disciplinary
measures initiated by the California Contractors State License Board against my license.

7. | recognize this construction permit application expires in 365 days if permit is not issued and 1 further
understand that a construction permit issued as a result of this application will expire 365 days after issuance for failure to
commence construction, or 2 years after issuance for failure to successfully finalize construction.

8. | agree to save, indemnify and keep harmless the County of Marin against liabilities, judgments, costs and
expenses which may in any way accrue against said County in consequence of the granting of this permit.

9. | understand | must satisfy the following Marin County requirements in order for this permit to be issued and
finalized:

1. Completed application form including REROOF PERMIT COMPLIANCE FORM (for CA Energy Commission)
and ROOF COVERING INSTALLATION CERTIFICATION FORM (for Marin County Class A roof covering).

2. Completed and submitted ELECTRONIC INSPECTION COMPLIANCE AND CERTIFICATION FORM and
PHOTO/VIDEO EVIDENCE OF COMPLIANCE with applicable State laws, Marin County Code requirements
and manufacturer’s specifications.

l‘hereby affirm under penalty of perjury by my signature below, | have read, understood and agree to the requirements
contained in this construction permit application and the information | have provided herein is correct.

California Licensed Contractor:

Signature Date

3501 Civic Center Drive - Suite 308 - San Rafael, CA 94903-4157 - 415 473 6550 T - 415 473 7432 F - 415 473 2255 TTY - www.marincounty.org/bldg



PG.40F 4

Directions for using this Electronic Inspection Reroof Permit Program

1. Obtain_permit and E-Inspection Compliance and Certification Form from Marin County
Community Development Agency — Building and Safety Division prior to starting work.

2. Review the Code requirements in the Residential Reroofing Code Reference Guide that are
applicable to your reroofing project prior to starting construction.

3. Using your smart phone, smart device or digital camera photograph or video the existing
roof before any tear-off or recovering has begun.

4. Using your E-Inspection Compliance and Certification Form as your guide:

a. Perform each inspection as soon as the corresponding work has been performed to
ensure each applicable code and/or manufacturer’s requirement is satisfied.

b. Photographl/video each inspection you perform to establish clear evidence that each
corresponding code and/or manufacturer's requirement is satisfied. Email each
photograph/video to buildinginspection@marincounty.org as soon as you take it.
CDA-Building & Safety will catalog each photo/video to your permit file.

c. Initial each inspection on your E-Inspection Compliance and Certification Form to
certify you performed the inspection and that the work performed complies with the
applicable code and/or manufacturer's requirement. NOTE: Write NA in the initialing
space for any inspection provision that is not applicable to your reroofing scope of work.

d. Sign the bottom of your completed E-Inspection Compliance and Certification Form.

5. Photograph/video the FRONT AND BACK of your Permit and completed E-Inspection
Compliance and Certification Form and email to buildinginspection@marincounty.org

6. Photograph/video the finished roof after all work is completed and email to
buildinginspection@marincounty.orq

7. Each photograph/video email must include your PERMIT NUMBER in the subject line of the
email: Example: PN 736550 E-Inspection. Your final email must include the word
“Final” in the subject line: Example: PN 736550 E-Final.

IMPORTANT!

l. E-Inspections will be reviewed by County technical staff in the order in which they are received.
Photographic/video inspection evidence that is incomplete and/or illegible will not be accepted as having satisfied
our E-Inspection requirements. Participation in our E-Inspection program does not guarantee CDA — Building &
Safety will approve your E-Inspections and finalize your permit. CDA — Building & Safety retains our authority to
require corrections and/or perform on-site inspection as deemed necessary by us.

. You will be notified by return email regarding the status of your E-Inspection permit after your photographic/video
inspection evidence has been reviewed.

3501 Civic Center Drive - Suite 308 - San Rafael, CA 94903-4157 - 415 473 6550 T - 415 473 7432 F - 415 473 2255 TTY - www.marincounty.org/bldg



Marin County Community Development Agency — Building &'Safety Division

Reroof Permit Compliance Fo_rm

Prescriptive Certificate of Compliance: Residential CF-1R-ALT Residential Alterations (Page 3 only of 5)

Project Name: Climate Zone # # of Stories

Site Address: l Date:

Building Type @ Single Family @ Multi Family

NOTE: This form is not to be used for Newly Constructed Biu'ldings or Additions

ROOFING PRODUCTS (COOL ROOFS) §151()12 --from 2008 Building Energy Efficiency Standards, Effective January 1, 2010

When the area of exterior roof surface to be replaced exceeds more than 50% of the existing roof area, or more than 1,000 fi2, whichever is less,
the new roofing area must meet the roofing product “Cool Roof” requirements of §152(b)1Hi, 152(b)1Hii, or 152(b)1 Hiil.

Check applicable alternative or exception below if the roof alteration-is exempt firom the roofing product “Cool Roof” requirements. Note: If any
one of the alternatives or exception below is checked, the Aged Solar Reflectance and Thermal Emittance requirements for roofing products in
$118(i) are not applicable. Do not fill table below.

@ Cool Roofs Not Required in Climate Zones 1-12, 14, and 16 with a Low Sloped Roof (less than or equal to 2:12 pitch). .
@ Cool Roofs Not Required in Climate Zones 1 through 9 and 16 with a Steep-Sloped Roofs (pitch greater than 2:12) and product unit weight less
than 5Ib/fta.

Alternatives to §152(b)1Hi and §152(b)Hii, Steep-slope roof (pitch > 2:12)
® Insulation with a thermal resistance of at least 0.85 hr-ft2-°F/Btu or at least a 3/4 inch air-space is added to the roof deck
over an attic; or @ Existing ducts in the attic are insulated and sealed according to §151(£)10; or
® Building has at least R-30 ceiling insulation; or @ Building has radiant barrier in the attic meeting the requirements of §151(f)2; or
® Building has no ducts in the attic.

Other Exceptions
@ Roofing arca covered by building-integrated photovoltaic panels and solar thermal panels are exempt from the below Cool Roof criteria.
@ Roof constructions that have thermal mass over the roof membrane with at least 25 1b/ft2 is exempt from the below Cool Roof criteria.

Note: If no CRRC-1 label is available, this compliance method cannot be used, use the Performance Approach to show compliance, otherwise,
Check the applicable box below if Exempt from the Roofing Products “Cool Roof” Requirement:

CRRC Product ID Roof Slope | Product Weight < | Product Typez Aged Solar Reflectances 4 Thermal - SRIs
Number <2:12>2:12 | Slb/ft2> Slb/fi2 Emittance

1. The CRRC Product ID Number can be obtained from the Cool Roof Rating Council’s Rated Product Directory at www.coolroofs.org/products/search.php

2. Indicate the type of product is being used for the roof top, i.e. single-ply roof, asphalt roaf, metal roof, etc.

3. If the Aged Reflectance is not available in the Cool Roof Rating Council’s Rated Product Directory then use the Initial Reflectance value from the same directory

and use the equation (0.2+0.7(Pinitial — 0.2) to obtain a calculated aged value. Where p is the Initial Solar Reflectance. :

4. Check box if the Aged Reflectance is a calculated value using the equation above.

5. Calculate the SRI value by using the SRI- Worksheet at http://www.energy.ca.gov/title24/ and enter the resulting value in the SRI Column above and attach acopy
of the SRI- Worksheet to the CF-1R. :

To apply Liquid Field Applied Coatings, the coating must be applied across the entire roof surface and meet the dry mil thickness or coverage
recommended by the coatings manufacturer and meet minimum performance requirements listed in §118(i)4. Select the applicable coating:

Aluminum-Pigmented Asphalt Roof Coating @ Cement-Based Roof Coating @ Other

For assistance or questions regarding the Energy Standards, contact the Energy Hotline at: 1-800-772-3300.

Documentation Author's Declaration: 1 certify that this Certificate of Compliance documentation is accurate and complete.

Name: 'Signature:

Company : Date:

Address: ’ If Applicable ©@ CEA or © CEPE (Certification #):
City/State/Zip: Phone:

Name: Signature:




ROOF COVERING INSTALLATION CERTIFICATION

Class ‘A’ Roof Assembly Requirements
~— Marin County Code Sec. 19.04.080 requires a Class "A’ roof covering be applied to the structure located at the address’

indicated below. The roof covering must also comply with the approved testing agency standards. This certification must
be completed by the contractor and posted with the inspection record card prior to final inspection.

Permit number:

Address of structure:

Roofing manufacturer:

Listing Agency (2007 CBC Sec. 1505:2):

Listing Agency approval number:

Manufacturer’'s specification or type:

Exception to Class ‘A’ requirement*:

*Exception: Repairs or replacements not exceeding 50% in any one year period.

INSTALLATION: (initials required)

| certify the required Class ‘A’ roof assembly for the above referenced project was installed to the manufacturers
approved ICC or UL listing, including roof deck, underlayment, interlayment, insulation and roof covering to this
listing.

I certify that the roof installed at the above listed address does comply with the approved plans, manufacturer's
installation standards and all listing requirements.

| certify that | made the pre-roofing inspection for this re-roofing job and that the substrate and/or existing roof
covering complied with CBC Chapter 15 prior to installation of the new roof cover. '

Company name:

Address:

State contractor’s license number:

Business phone number:_

Contractor Signature : Date



Marin County Community Development Agency
Residential Smoke/CO Detector Guidelines

Important Smoke Alarm Notice for Homeowners

CA Health & Safety Code Section 13113.7 and CA Residential Code Section R314
require
Installation of smoke alarms, approved and listed by the State Fire Marshal, in all
dwelling units intended for human occupancy, upon the owner’s application on or after
January 1, 1985, for a permit for alterations, repairs, or additions, exceeding one
thousand dollars ($1,000).

You are receiving this Notice because a building permit application
for work exceeding $1,000 is being applied for involving your
property. Smoke alarms, approved and listed by the State Fire

Marshal, are required in compliance with the following:

Locations —

1. In each sleeping room.

2. Outside each separate sleeping area in the immediate vicinity of the bedrooms.

3. On each additional story of the dwelling, including basements and habitable attics.

4. On split level floors without an intervening wall the smoke detector on the upper level
shall suffice for the adjacent lower level.

Power source and interconnection —

Smoke alarms are permitted to be solely battery operated, and do not require
interconnected activation, in existing buildings where no construction is taking place,
and in existing buildings undergoing alterations or repairs that do not result in the
removal of interior walls or ceiling finishes exposing the structure, unless there is access
to the building wiring without the removal of interior finishes.

Multiple purpose alarms —

Approved household fire alarm systems that include smoke alarms, or approved smoke
alarms combined with carbon monoxide alarms may be used to satisfy the requirements
of this Notice.

See reverse



Marin County Community Development Agency
Residential Smoke/CO Detector Guidelines

Important Carbon Monoxide Alarm Notice
for Homeowners

CA Health & Safety Code Section 17926 and CA Residential Code Section R315
require
Installation of carbon monoxide alarms, listed as complying with UL 2034, UL 2075 and
in accordance with NFPA 720, in all dwelling units that have attached garages or fuel-
burning appliances, upon the owner’s application for a permit for alterations, repairs, or
additions, exceeding one thousand dollars ($1,000).

You are receiving this Notice because a building permit application
for work exceeding $1,000 is being applied for involving your
property. Carbon monoxide alarms, meeting the standards referenced
in this Notice, are required in compliance with the following:

Locations —

1. Outside each separate sleeping area in the immediate vicinity of the bedrooms.

2. On every level of the dwelling, including basements.

Power source and interconnection —
Carbon monoxide alarms are permitted to be solely battery operated, and do not require
interconnected activation, in existing buildings undergoing alterations or repairs that do

not result in the removal of interior walls or ceiling finishes exposing the structure,
unless there is access to the building wiring without the removal of interior finishes.

Multiple purpose alarms —

Approved carbon monoxide alarms combined with approved smoke alarms may be
used to satisfy the requirements of this Notice.

See reverse



CHAPTER 9
ROOF ASSEMBLIES

SECTION R901
GENERAL

R901.1 Scope. The provisions of this chapter shall govern the
design, materials, construction and quality of roof assemblies.

SECTION R902
ROOF CLASSIFICATION

R902.1 Reofing covering materials. Roofs shall be covered
with materials as set forth in Sections R904 and R905. A mini-
mum Class A, B or C roofing shall be installed in areas desig-
nated by this section. Classes A, B and C roofing required by
this section to be listed shall be tested in accordance with UL
790 or ASTM E 108.

Exceptions:

1. Class A roof assemblies include those with coverings
of brick, masonry and exposed concrete roof deck.

2. Class A roof assemblies also include ferrous or cop-
per shingles or sheets, metal sheets and shingles, clay

or concrete roof tile, or slate installed on noncom-

bustible decks.

R902.1.1 Roof coverings within Very-High Fire Hazard
Severity Zones. The entire roof covering of every existing
structure where more than 50 percent of the total roof area is
replaced within any one-year period, the entire roof cover-
ing of every new structure, and any roof covering applied in
the alteration, repair or replacement of the roof of every
existing structure, shall be a fire-retardant roof coyering
that is at least Class A.

Exception: The requirements shall not apply in any
jurisdiction that adopts the model ordinance approved
by the State Fire Marshal pursuant to Section 51189 of
the Government Code or an ordinance that substantially
conforms to the model ordinance and transmits a copy to
the State Fire Marshal.

R902.1.2 Roof coverings within State Responsibility
Areas. The entire roof covering of every existing structure
where more than 50 percent of the total roof area is replaced
within any one-year period, the entire roof covering of every
new structure, and any roof covering applied in the alter-
ation, repair or replacement of the roof of every existing
structure, shall be a fire-retardant roof covering that is at
least Class B.

Exception: Areas designated as moderate fire hazard
severity zones.

R902.1.3 Roof coverings in all other areas. The entire roof
covering of every existing structure where more than 50 per-
cent of the total roof area is replaced within any one-year
period, the entire roof covering of every new structure, and

2010 CALIFORNIA RESIDENTIAL CODE

any roof covering applied in the alteration, repair or
replacement of the roof of every existing structure, shall be a
fire-retardant roof covering that is at least Class C.

R902.1.4 Roofing requirements a Wildland-Urban Inter-
face Fire Area. Roofing requirements for structures located
in a Wildland-Urban Interface Fire Area shall also comply
with Section R327.5.

R902.2 Fire-retardant-treated shingles and shakes. Fire-
retardant-treated wood shakes and shingles are wood shakes
and shingles complying with UBC Standard 15-3 or 15-4
which are impregnated by the full-cell vacuum-pressure pro-
cess with fire-retardant chemicals, and which have been quali-
fied by UBC Standard 15-2 for use on Class A, B or C roofs.

Fire-retardant-treated wood shakes and shingles shall com-
ply with ICC-ES EG107 and with the weathering requirements
contained in Health and Safety Code Section 13132.7 (j). Each
bundle shall bear labels from an ICBO accredited quality con-
trol agency identifying their roof-covering classification and
indicating their compliance with ICC-ES EG107 and with the
weathering requirements contained in Health and Safety Code
Section 13132.7 (j).

Health and Safety Code Section 13132.7 (j} No wood roof
covering materials shall be sold or applied in this state unless
both of the following conditions are met:

(1) The materials have been approved and listed by the State
Fire Marshal as complying with the requirements of this
section.

(2) The materials have passed at least five years of the
10-year natural weathering test. The 10-year natural
weathering test required by this subdivision shall be con-
ducted in accordance with Standard 15-2 of the 1994 edi-
tion of the Uniform Building Code at a testing facility
recognized by the State Fire Marshal.

SECTION R903
WEATHER PROTECTION

R903.1 General. Roof decks shall be covered with approved
roof coverings secured to the building or structure in accor-
dance with the provisions of this chapter. Roof assemblies shall
be designed and installed in accordance with this code and the
approved manufacturer’s installation instructions such that the
roof assembly shall serve to protect the building or structure.

R903.2 Flashing. Flashings shall be installed in a manner that
prevents moisture from entering the wall and roof through
joints in copings, through moisture permeable materials and at
intersections with parapet walls and other penetrations through
the roof plane.

493




ROOF ASSEMBLIES

Y
<y
S
<Ko
oy
=
Pt .\
mﬂ/
kN
> i
mws }
™

L

dVIN FHNSOdX3A TIVH
58064 UNDIA

S

sieah gg/hep Jiey | wnuuin (U 0°6 - 0°2) o21s asenss B
s1eak 0z/Aep 1By | wiumy (Ul 0°G - °L) 971G ejesepoly

2010 CALIFORNIA RESIDENTIAL CODE

494



R903.2.1 Locations. Flashings shall be installed at wall and
roof intersections, wherever there is a change in roof slope or
direction and around roof openings. Where flashing is of
metal, the metal shall be corrosion resistant with a thickness of
pot less than 0.019 inch (0.5 mm) (No. 26 galvanized sheet).

R903.2.2 Crickets and saddles. A cricket or saddle shall be
installed on the ridge side of any chimney or penetration
more than 30 inches (762 mm) wide as measured perpendic-
ular to the slope. Cricket or saddle coverings shall be sheet
metal or of the same material as the roof covering.

R903.3 Coping. Parapet walls shall be properly coped with
noncombustible, weatherproof materials of a width no less
than the thickness of the parapet wall.

R903.4 Roof drainage. Unless roofs are sloped to drain over
roof edges, roof drains shall be installed at each low point of the
roof. Where required for roof drainage, scuppers shall be
placed level with the roof surface in a wall or parapet. The scup-
per shall be located as determined by the roof slope and con-
tributing roof area.

R903.4.1 Overflow drains and scuppers. Where roof
drains are required, overflow drains having the same size as
the roof drains shall be installed with the inlet flow line
located 2 inches (51 mm) above the low point of the roof, or
overflow scuppers having three times the size of the roof
drains and having a minimum opening height of 4 inches
(102 mm) shall be installed in the adjacent parapet walls
with the inlet flow located 2 inches (51 mm) above the low
point of the roof served. The installation and sizing of over-
flow drains, leaders and conductors shall comply with the
California Plumbing Code.

R903.5 Hail exposure. Hail exposure, as specified in Sections
R903.5.1 and R903.5.2, shall be determined using Figure RO03.5.

R903.5.1 Moderate hail exposure. One or more hail days
with hail diameters larger than 1.5 inches (38 mm) in a
20-year period.

R903.5.2 Severe hail exposure. One or more hail days with
hail diameters larger than or equal to 2.0 inches (51 mm) ina
20-year period.

SECTION RS04
MATERIALS

R904.1 Scope. The requirements set forth in this section shall
apply to the application of roof covering materials specified
herein. Roof assemblies shall be applied in accordance with
this chapter and the manufacturer’s installation instructions.
Installation of roof assemblies shall comply with the applicable
provisions of Section R905.

R904.2 Compatibility of materials. Roof assemblies shall be
of materials that are compatible with each other and with the
building or structure to which the materials are applied.

R904.3 Material specifications and physical characteris-
tics. Roof covering materials shall conform to the applicable
standards listed in this chapter. In the absence of applicable
standards or where materials are of questionable suitability,
testing by an approved testing agency shall be required by the

2010 CALIFORNIA RESIDENTIAL CODE

ROOF ASSEMBLIES

building official to determine the character, quality and limita-
tions of application of the materials.

R904.4 Product identification. Roof covering materials shall
be delivered in packages bearing the manufacturer’s identify-
ing marks and approved testing agency labels when required.
Bulk shipments of materials shall be accompanied by the same
information issued in the form of a certificate or on a bill of lad-
ing by the manufacturer.

SECTION R905
REQUIREMENTS FOR ROOF COVERINGS

R905.1 Roof covering application. Roof coverings shall be
applied in accordance with the applicable provisions of this
section and the manufacturer’s installation instructions. Unless
otherwise specified in this section, roof coverings shall be
installed to resist the component and cladding loads specified
in Table R301.2(2), adjusted for height and exposure in accor-
dance with Table R301.2(3).

R905.2 Asphalt shingles. The installation of asphalt shingles
shall comply with the provisions of this section.

R905.2.1 Sheathing requirements. Asphalt shingles shall
be fastened to solidly sheathed decks.

R905.2.2 Slope. Asphalt shingles shall be used only onroof
slopes of two units vertical in 12 units horizontal (2:12) or
greater. For toof slopes from two units vertical in 12 units
horizontal (2:12) up to four units vertical in 12 units hori-
zontal (4:12), double underlayment application is required
in accordance with Section R905.2.7.

R905.2.3 Underlayment. Unless otherwise noted, required
underlayment shall conform to ASTM D 226 Type I, ASTM
D 4869 Type I, or ASTM D 6757.

Self-adhering polymer modified bitumen sheet shall
comply with ASTM D 1970.

R905.2.4 Asphalt shingles. Asphalt shingles shall comply
with ASTM D 225 or D 3462.

R905.2.4.1 Wind resistance of asphalt shingles. Asphalt
shingles shall be tested in accordance with ASTM D 7158,
Asphalt shingles shall meet the classification requirements
of Table R905.2.4.1(1) for the appropriate maximum basic
wind speed. Asphalt shingle packaging shall bear a label to
indicate compliance with ASTM D 7158 and the required
classification in Table R905.2.4.1(1).

Exception: Asphalt shingles not included in the
scope of ASTM D 7158 shall be tested and labeled to
indicate compliance with ASTM D 3161 and the
required classification in Table R905.2.4.1(2).

R905.2.5 Fasteners. Fasteners for asphalt shingles shall be
galvanized steel, stainless steel, aluminum or copper roofing
nails, minimum 12 gage [0.105 inch (3 mm)] shank with a
minimum 3/-inch (10 mm) diameter head, ASTM F 1667, of
alength to penetrate through the roofing materials and a mini-
mum of ¥, inch (19 mm) into the roof sheathing. Where the
roof sheathing is less than %/, inch (19 mm) thick, the fasteners
shall penetrate through the sheathing. Fasteners shall comply
with ASTM F 1667. :

485




ROOF ASSEMBLIES

TABLE R905,2.4.1(1)
CLASSIFICATION OF ASPHALT ROOF SHINGLES PER ASTM D 7158

MAXIMUM BASIC WIND SPEED FROM FIGURE 301.2(4) (mph) CLASSIFICATION REQUIREMENT

85 D,GorH

90 D,Gor H

100 GorH

110 GorH

120 GorH

130 H

140 H

150 H

For SI:

1 mile per hour = 0.447 m/s.

TABLE R905.2.4.1(2)
CLASSIFICATION OF ASPHALT SHINGLES PER ASTM D 3161

MAXIMUM BASIC WIND SPEED FROM FIGURE 301.2(4) (mph) CLASSIFICATION REQUIREMENT

85 A,DorF

90 A,DorF

100 A, DorF
110 F
120 F
130 F
140 F
| 150 F

For SL.

1 mile per hour = 0.447 m/s.

R905.2.6 Attachment. Asphalt shingles shall have the mini-
mum number of fasteners required by the manufacturer, but
not less than four fasteners per strip shingle or two fasteners
per individual shingle. Where the roof slope exceeds 21 units
vertical in 12 units horizontal (21:12, 175 percent slope),
shingles shall be installed as required by the manufacturer,

R905.2.7 Underlayment application. For roof slopes from
two units vertical in 12 units horizontal (17-percent slope), up
to four units vertical in 12 units horizontal (33-percent slope),
underlayment shall be two layers applied in the following
manner. Apply a 19-inch (483 mm) strip of underlayment felt
parallel to and starting at the eaves, fastened sufficiently to
hold in place. Starting at the eave, apply 36-inch-wide (914
mm) sheets of underlayment, overlapping successive sheets
19 inches (483 mm), and fastened sufficiently to hold in
place. Distortions in the underlayment shall not interfere with
the ability of the shingles to seal. For roof slopes of four units
vertical in 12 units horizontal (33-percent slope) or greater,
underlayment shall be one layer applied in the following
manner, Underlayment shall be applied shingle fashion, par-
allel to and starting from the eave and lapped 2 inches (51
mm), fastened sufficiently to hold in place. Distortions in the
underlayment shall not interfere with the ability of the shin-
gles to seal. End laps shall be offset by 6 feet (1829 mm).

496

R905.2.7.1 Ice barrier. In areas where there has been a his-
tory of ice forming along the eaves causing a backup of water
as designated in Table R301.2(1), an ice barrier that consists
of aleast two layers of underlayment cemented together or of
a self-adhering polymer modified bitumen sheet, shall be
used in lien of normal underlayment and extend from the
lowest edges of all roof surfaces to a point at least 24 inches
(610 mm) inside the exterior wall line of the building.

Exception: Detached accessory structures that con-
tain no conditioned floor area.

R905.2.7.2 Underlayment and high wind. Underlayment
applied in areas subject to high winds [above 110 mph (49
ny/s) per Figure R301.2(4)] shall be applied with corro-
sion-resistant fasteners in accordance with manufacturer’s
instaflation instructions. Fasteners are to be applied along the
overlap not farther apart than 36 inches (914 mm) on center.

R905.2.8 Flashing. Flashing for asphalt shingles shall com-
ply with this section.

R905.2.8.1 Base and cap flashing. Base and cap flashing
shall be installed in accordance with manufacturer’s instal-
lation instructions. Base flashing shall be of either corro-
sion-resistant metal of minimam nominal 0.019-inch (0.5
mm) thickness or mineral surface roll roofing weighing a
minimum of 77 pounds per 100 square feet (4 kg/m?). Cap

2010 CALIFORNIA RESIDENTIAL CODE



flashing shall be corrosion-resistant metal of minimum
nominal 0.019-inch (0.5 mm) thickness.

R905.2.8.2 Valleys. Valley linings shall be installed in
accordance with the manufacturer’s installation instruc-
tions before applying shingles. Valley linings of the fol-
lowing types shall be permitted:

1. For open valleys (valley lining exposed) lined with
metal, the valley lining shall be at least 24 inches
(610 mm) wide and of any of the corrosion-resis-
tant metals in Table R905.2.8.2.

2. For open valleys, valley lining of two plies of min-
eral surfaced roll roofing, complying with ASTM
D 3909 or ASTM D 6380 Class M, shall be permit-
ted. The bottom layer shall be 18 inches (457 mm)
and the top layer a minimum of 36 inches (914
mm) wide.

3. For closed valleys (valley covered with shingles),
valley lining of one ply of smooth roll roofing
complying with ASTM D 6380 and at least 36
inches wide (914 mm) or valley lining as described
inItem 1 or 2 above shall be permitted. Self-adher-
ing polymer modified bitumen underlayment
complying with ASTM D 1970 shall be permitted
in lieu of the lining material.

TABLE R905.2.8.2
VALLEY LINING MATERIAL
MINIMUM
THICKNESS WEIGHT
MATERIAL (inches) GAGE (pounds)
ASTM B 370,
Cold-rolled copper 0'02.16 — 16 oz. per
nominal
square foot
ASTM B 101,
Lead-coated copper 0'02.16 — 16 oz. per
nominal
square foot
ASTM B 370
. . 0.0162 ?
High-yield copper nominal — 12 oz. per
square foot
Lead-coated 0.0162 ASTMB 101,
high-yield copper nominal — 12 oz. per
square foot
Aluminum 0.024 — —
Stainless steel — 28 —
;. 26 (zinc
Galvanized steel 0.0179 coated GOO) —
Zinc alloy 0.027 — —
Lead — — 21,
Painted terme — — 20

For SI: 1 inch =25.4 mm, 1 pound = 0.454 kg.

R905.2.8.3 Sidewall flashing. Flashing against a verti-
cal sidewall shall be by the step-flashing method. The
flashing shall be a minimum of 4 inches (102 mm) high
and 4 inches (102 mm) wide. At the end of the vertical
sidewall the step flashing shall be turned out in a manner
that directs water away from the wall and onto the roof
and/or gutter.

2010 CALIFORNIA RESIDENTIAL CODE

ROOF ASSEMBLIES

R905.2.8.4 Other flashing. Flashing against a vertical
front wall, as well as soil stack, vent pipe and chimney
flashing, shall be applied according to the asphalt shingle
manufacturer’s printed instructions.

R905.3 Clay and conerete tile. The instalflation of clay and
concrete tile shall comply with the provisions of this section.

R905.3.1 Deck requirements. Corncrete and clay tile shall
be installed only over solid sheathing or spaced structural
sheathing boards.

R905.3.2 Deck slope. Clay and concrete roof tile shall be
installed on roof slopes of two and one-half units vertical in
12 units horizontal ( 2!/,:12) or greater. For roof slopes from
two and one-half units vertical in 12 units horizontal
(21/,:12) to four units vertical in 12 units horizontal (4:12),
double underlayment application is required in accordance
with Section R905.3.3.

R905.3.3 Underlayment. Unless otherwise noted, required
underlayment shall conform to ASTM D 226 Type II
ASTM D 2626 Type T; or ASTM D 6380 Class M mineral
surfaced roll roofing.

R905.3.3.1 Low slope roofs. For roof slopes from two
and one-half units vertical in 12 units horizontal
(2%/,:12), up to four units vertical in 12 units horizontal
(4:12), underlayment shall be a minimum of two layers
underlayment applied as follows:

1. Starting at the eave, a 19-inch (483 mm) strip of
underlayment shall be applied paralle] with the
eave and fastened sufficiently in place.

2. Starting at the eave, 36-inch-wide (914 mm) strips
of underlayment felt shall be applied, overlapping
successive sheets 19 inches (483 mm), and fas-
tened sufficiently in place.

R905.3.3.2 High slope roofs. For roof slopes of four
units vertical in 12 units horizontal (4:12) or greater,
underlayment, shall be a minimum of one layer of
underlayment felt applied shingle fashion, parallel to and
starting from the eaves and lapped 2 inches (51 mm), fas-
tened sufficiently in place.

R905.3.3.3 Underlayment and high wind. Underlay-
ment applied in areas subject to high wind [over 110
miles per hour (49 my/s) per Figure R301.2(4)] shall be
applied with corrosion-resistant fasteners in accordance
with manufacturer’s installation instructions. Fasteners
are to be applied along the overlap not farther apart than
36 inches (914 mm) on center.

R905.3.4 Clay tile. Clay roof tile shall comply with ASTM
C1167.

R905.3.5 Concrete tile. Concrete roof tile shall comply
with ASTM C 1492.

R905.3.6 Fasteners. Nails shall be corrosion resistant and
not less than 11 gage, %,¢-inch (11 mm) head, and of suffi-
cient length to penetrate the deck a minimum of 3/, inch (19
mm) or through the thickness of the deck, whichever is less.
Attaching wire for clay or concrete tile shall not be smaller
than 0.083 inch (2 mm). Perimeter fastening areas include

497



ROOF ASSEMBLIES

three tile courses but not less than 36 inches (914 mm) from
either side of hips or ridges and edges of eaves and gable
rakes.

R905.3.7 Application. Tile shall be applied in accordance
with this chapter and the manufacturer's installation instruc-
tions, based on the following:

1. Climatic conditions.

2. Roof slope.

3. Underlayment system.

4. Type of tile being installed.

Clay and concrete roof tiles shall be fastened in accor-
dance with this section and the manufacturer’s installation
instructions. Perimeter tiles shall be fastened with a mini-
mum of one fastener per tile. Tiles with installed weight less
than 9 pounds per square foot (0.4 kg/m?) require a mini-
mum of one fastener per tile regardless of roof slope. Clay
and concrete roof tile attachment shall be in accordance
with the manufacturer’s installation instructions where
applied in areas where the wind speed exceeds 100 miles per
hour (45 m/s) and on buildings where the roof is located
more than 40 feet (12 192 mm) above grade. In areas subject
to snow, a minimum of two fasteners per tile is required. In
all other areas, clay and concrete roof tiles shall be attached
in accordance with Table R905.3.7.

TABLE R905.3.7
CLAY AND CONCRETE TILE ATTACHMENT
NUMBER OF
SHEATHING ROOF SLOPE FASTENERS
Solid without battens All One per tile
Spaced or solid
with battens and Fasteners not required —
slope <5:12
One per tile/eve
Spaced sheathing | 5:12 < slope < 12:12 erron
without battens
12:12 < slope < 24:12 One per tile

R905.3.8 Flashing. At the juncture of roof vertical surfaces,
flashing and counterflashing shall be provided in accor-
dance with this chapter and the manufacturer’s installation
instructions and, where of metal, shall not be less than 0.019
inch (0.5 mm) (No. 26 galvanized sheet gage) corro-
sion-resistant metal. The valley flashing shall extend at least
11inches (279 mm) from the centerline each way and have a
splash diverter rib not less than 1 inch (25 mm) high at the
flow line formed as part of the flashing. Sections of flashing
shall have an end lap of not less than 4 inches (102 mm). For
roof slopes of three units vertical in 12 units horizontal
(25-percent slope) and greater, valley flashing shall have a
36-inch-wide (914 mm) underlayment of one layer of Type I
vnderlayment running the full length of the valley, in addi-
tion to other required underlayment. In areas where the
average daily temperature in January is 25°F (-4°C) or less,
metal valley flashing underlayment shall be solid-cemented
to the roofing underlayment for slopes less than seven units
vertical in 12 units horizontal (58-percent slope) or be of
self-adhering polymer modified bitumen sheet.

498

R905.4 Metal roof shingles. The installation of metal roof
shingles shall comply with the provisions of this section.

R905.4.1 Deck requirements. Metal roof shingles shall be
applied to a solid or closely fitted deck, except where the
roof covering is specifically designed to be applied to
spaced sheathing.

R905.4.2 Deck slope. Metal roof shingles shall not be
installed on roof slopes below three units verticalin 12 units
horizontal (25-percent slope).

R905.4.3 Underlayment. Underlayment shall comply with
ASTM D 226, Type I or Type II, ASTM D 4869, Type I or
Type I, or ASTM D 1970. Underlayment shall be installed
in accordance with the manufacturer’s installation instruc-
tions.

R905.4.3.1 Ice barrier. In areas where there has been a
history of ice forming along the eaves causing a backup
of water as designated in Table R301.2(1), an ice barrier
that consists of at least two layers of underlayment
cemented together or a self-adhering polymer modified
bitumen sheet shall be used in place of normal
underlayment and extend from the lowest edges of all
roof surfaces to a point atleast 24 inches (610 mm) inside
the exterior wall line of the building.

Exception: Detached accessory structures that con-
tain no conditioned floor area.

R905.4.4 Material standards. Metal roof shingle roof cov-
erings shall comply with Table R905.10.3(1). The materials
used for metal roof shingle roof coverings shall be naturally
corrosion resistant or be made corrosion resistant in accor-
dance with the standards and minimum thicknesses listed in
Table R905.10.3(2).

R905.4.5 Application. Metal roof shingles shall be secured
to the roof in accordance with this chapter and the approved
manufacturer’s installation instructions.

R905.4.6 Flashing. Roof valley flashing shall be of corro-
sion-resistant metal of the same material as the roof cover-
ing or shall comply with the standards in Table
R905.10.3(1). The valley flashing shall extend at least 8
inches (203 mm) from the center line each way and shall
have a splash diverter rib not less than 3/, inch (19 mm) high
at the flow line formed as part of the flashing. Sections of
flashing shall have an end lap of not less than 4 inches (102
mm). The metal valley flashing shall have a 36-inch-wide
(914 mm) underlayment directly under it consisting of one
layer of underlayment running the full length of the valley,
in addition to underlayment required for metal roof shin-
gles. In areas where the average daily temperature in Janu-
ary is 25°F (-4°C) or less, the metal valley flashing
underlayment shall be solid cemented to the roofing
underlayment for roof slopes under seven units vertical in
12 units horizontal (58-percent slope) or self-adhering poly-
mer modified bitumen sheet.

R905.5 Mineral-surfaced roll roofing. The installation of min-
eral-surfaced roll roofing shall comply with this section.

R905.5.1 Deck requirements. Mineral-surfaced roll roof-
ing shall be fastened to solidly sheathed roofs.

2010 CALIFORNIA RESIDENTIAL CODE



R905.5.2 Deck slope. Mineral-surfaced roll roofing shall
not be applied on roof slopes below one unit vertical in 12
units horizontal (8-percent slope).

R965.5.3 Underlayment. Underlayment shall comply with
ASTM D 226, Type I or ASTM D 4869, Type Lor IL.

R905.5.3.1 Ice barrier. In areas where there has been a
history of ice forming along the eaves causing a backup
of water as designated in Table R301.2(1), an ice barrier
that consists of at least two layers of underlayment
cemented together or a self-adhering polymer modified
bitumen sheet shall be used in place of normal
underlayment and extend from the lowest edges of all
roof surfaces to a point at least 24 inches (610 mm) inside
the exterior wall line of the building.

Exception: Detached accessory structures that con-
tain no conditioned floor area.

R905.5.4 Material standards. Mineral-surfaced roll roof-
ing shall conform to ASTM D 3909 or ASTM D 6380,
Class M.

ROOF ASSEMBLIES

shingles shall be installed in accordance with this chapter
and the manufacturer’s installation instructions.

TABLE R905.6.5
SLATE SHINGLE HEADLAP

SLOPE HEADLAP (inches)

4:12 < slope < 8:12 4

8:12 <slope <20:12 3

Slope £20:12 2

For SI: 1inch =254 mm.

R905.6.6 Flashing. Flashing and counterflashing shall be
made with sheet metal. Valley flashing shall be a minimum
of 15 inches (381 mm) wide. Valley and flashing metal shall
be a minimum uncoated thickness of 0.0179-inch (0.5 mm)
zinc coated G90. Chimneys, stucco or brick walls shall have
a minimum of two plies of felt for a cap flashing consisting
of a 4-inch-wide (102 mm) strip of felt set in plastic cement
and extending 1 inch (25 mm) above the first felt and a top
coating of plastic cement. The felt shall extend over the base
flashing 2 inches (51 mm). :

R905.5.5 Application. Mineral-surfaced roll roofing shall
be installed in accordance with this chapter and the manu-
facturer’s installation instructions.

R905.6 Slate and slate-type shingles. The installation of slate
and slate-type shingles shall comply with the provisions of this
section.

R905.7 Wood shingles. The installation of wood shingles shall
comply with the provisions of this section.

R905.7.1 Deck requirements. Wood shingles shall be
installed on solid or spaced sheathing. Where spaced
sheathing is used, sheathing boards shall not be less than

R905.6.1 Deck requirements. Slate shingles shall be fas-
tened to solidly sheathed roofs.

. R905.6.2 Deck slope. Slate shingles shall be used only on
slopes of four units vertical in 12 units horizontal (33-per-
cent slope) or gredter.

R905.6.3 Underlayment. Underlayment shall comply with
ASTM D 226, Type I, or ASTM D 4869, Type I or 1I.
Underlayment shall be installed in accordance with the
manufacturer’s installation instructions.

R905.6.3.1 Ice barrier. In areas where there has been a
history of ice forming along the eaves causing a backup
of water as designated in Table R301.2(1), an ice barrier
that comsists of at least two layers of underlayment
cemented together or a self-adhering polymer modified
bitumen sheet shall be used in lieu of normal
underlayment and extend from the lowest edges of ail
roof surfaces to a point at least 24 inches (610 mm) inside
the exterior wall line of the building.

Exception: Detached accessory structures that con-
tain no conditioned floor area.

R905.6.4 Material standards. Slate shingles shall comply
with ASTM C 406.

R905.6.5 Application. Minimum headlap for slate shingles
shall be in accordance with Table R905.6.5. Slate shingles
shall be secured to the roof with two fasteners per slate. Slate

2010 CALIFORNIA RESIDENTIAL CODE

1-inch by 4-inch (25.4 mm by 102 mm) nominal dimensions
and shall be spaced on centers equal to the weather exposure
to coincide with the placement of fasteners.

R905.7.1.1 Solid sheathing required. In areas where
the average daily temperature in January is 25°F (-4°C)
or less, solid sheathing is required on that portion of the
roof requiring the application of an ice barrier.

R905.7.2 Deck slope. Wood shingles shall be installed on
slopes of three units vertical in 12 units horizontal (25-per-
cent slope) or greater.

R905.7.3 Underlayment. Underlayment shali comply with
ASTM D 226, Type I or ASTM D 4869, Type I or II.

R905.7.3.1 Ice barrier. In areas where there has been a
history of ice forming along the eaves causing a backup
of water as designated in Table R301.2(1), an ice barrier
that consists of at least two layers of underlayment
cemented together or a self-adhering polymer modified
bitumen sheet shall be used in lieu of normal
underlayment and extend from the lowest edges of all
roof surfaces to a point at least 24 inches (610 mm) inside
the exterior wall line of the building.

Exception: Detached accessory structures that con-
tain no conditioned floor area.

R905.7.4 Material standards. Wood shingles shall be of
naturally durable wood and comply with the requirements
of Table R905.7.4.

499



ROOF ASSEMBLIES

TABLE R905.7.4
WOOD SHINGLE MATERIAL REQUIREMENTS

APPLICABLE

MATERIAL MINIMUM GRADES | GRADING RULES

Wood shingles of L 20r3 Cedar Shake and
naturally durable wood oot Shingle Bureau

R905.7.5 Application. Wood shingles shall be installed
according to this chapter and the manufacturer’s installation
instructions. Wood shingles shall be laid with a side lap not
less than 1Y/, inches (38 mm) between joints in courses, and
no two joints in any three adjacent courses shall be in direct
alignment. Spacing between shingles shall not be less than Y/,
inch to 3/ inch (6 mm to 10 mm). Weather exposure for wood
shingles shall not exceed those set in Table R905.7.5. Fasten-
ers for wood shingles shall be corrosion resistant with a mini-
mum penetration of !/, inch (13 mm) into the sheathing. For
sheathing less than '/, inch (13 mm) in thickness, the fasteners
shall extend through the sheathing. Wood shingles shall be
attached to the roof with two fasteners per shingle, positioned
no more than ¥, inch (19 mm) from each edge and no more
than 1 inch (25 mm) above the exposure line.

R905.8.1 Deck requirements. Wood shakes shall be used
only on solid or spaced sheathing. Where spaced sheathing is
used, sheathing boards shall not be less than 1-inch by 4-inch
(25 mm by 102 mm) nominal dimensions and shall be spaced
on centers equal to the weather exposure to coincide with the
placement of fasteners. Where 1-inch by 4-inch (25 mm by
102 mm) spaced sheathing is installed at 10 inches (254 mm)
on center, additional 1-inch by 4-inch (25 mm by 102 mm)
boards shall be installed between the sheathing boards.

R905.8.1.1 Solid sheathing required. In areas where
the average daily temperature in January is 25°F (-4°C)
or less, solid sheathing is required on that portion of the
roof requiring an ice barrier.

R905.8.2 Deck slope. Wood shakes shall only be used on
slopes of three units vertical in 12 units horizontal (25-per-
cent slope) or greater.

R905.8.3 Underlayment. Underlayment shall comply with
ASTM D 226, Type 1 or ASTM D 4869, Type L or II.

R905.8.3.1 Ice barrier. In areas where there has been a
history of ice forming along the eaves causing a backup
of water as designated in Table R301.2(1), an ice barrier

TABLE RY05.7.5 that consists of at least two layers of underlayment
WOOD SHINGLE WEATHER EXPOSURE AND ROOF SLOPE cemented together or a self-adhering polymer modified
EXPOSURE (inches) bitumen sheet shall be used in place of normal
ROOFING LENGTH 3:42 pitch to|4:12 pitch or underlayment and extend from the lowest edges of all
MATERIAL (inches) GRADE <4112 steeper roof surfaces to a point at least 24 inches (610 mm) inside
No. 1 3, 5 the exterior wall line of the building.
; Exception: Detached accessory structures that con-
16 No.2 3 4 tain no conditioned floor area.
No. 3 3 3 R905.8.4 Interlayment. Interlayment shall comply with
. No. 1 41, 51, ASTM D 226, Type L.
Shingles of ‘
naturally durable 18 No. 2 4 41/, R905.8.5 Material standards. Wood shakes shall comply
wood with the requirements of Table R905.8.5.
No. 3 31/, 4
TABLE R905.8.5
No. 1 5%, 7, WOOD SHAKE MATERIAL REQUIREMENTS
24 No.2 Sty 6y MATERIAL "ém“été'é” APPLIcﬁJﬁgRMING
No. 3 5 5t ‘Wood shakes of naturally 1 Cedar Shake and
ForSI: 1 inch =25.4 mm, durable wood Shingle Bureau
R905.7.6 Valley flashing. Roof flashing shall be not less Taper Sbalwn shakes of naturally | ¢ . » Cedﬁ Sllmlg and
than No. 26 gage [0.019 inches (0.5 mm)] corrosion-resis- dura ?WOOd Shingle Burcau
tant sheet metal and shall extend 10 inches (254 mm) from Preservative-treated shakes Cedar Shake and
the centerline each way for roofs having slopes less than 12 and shingles of naturally 1 Shingle Bureau
units vertical in 12 units horizontal (100-percent slope), and durable wood
7 inches ‘(178 rqm) from thevcenter'line each way for slopes Fire-retardant-treated shakes Cedar Shake and
of 12 units vertical in 12 units horizontal and greater. Sec- and shingles of naturally 1 Shingle Bureau
tions of flashing shall have an end lap of not less than durable wood .
inches (102 mm). ' Preservative-treated taper sawn
. . shakes of Southern pine Forest Producis
R905.7.7 Label required. Each bundle of shingles shall be treated in accordance with Olrfsb rocu .
identified by a label of an approved grading or inspection AWPA Standard U1l lTor2 szg;‘%zz S‘z ©
burean or agency. (Commodity Specification Services
A, Use Category 3B and
R905.8 Wood shakes. The installation of wood shakes shall Section 3.6)

comply with the provisions of this section.

500

2010 CALIFORNIA RESIDENTIAL CODE



R905.8.6 Application. Wood shakes shall be installed
according to this chapter and the manufacturer’s installation
instructions. Wood shakes shall be laid with a side lap not
less than 1Y, inches (38 mm) between joints in adjacent
courses. Spacing between shakes in the same course shall be
3/, inch to %/; inch (9.5 mm to 15.9 mm) for shakes and
tapersawn shakes of naturally durable wood and shall be */;
inch to %y inch (9.5 mm to 15.9 mm) for preservative-treated
taper sawn shakes. Weather exposure for wood shakes shall
not exceed those set forth in Table R905.8.6. Fasteners for
wood shakes shall be corrosion-resistant, with a minimum
penetration of !/, inch (12.7 mm) into the sheathing. For
sheathing less than '/, inch (12.7 mm) thick, the fasteners
shall extend through the sheathing. Wood shakes shall be
attached to the roof with two fasteners per shake, positioned
no more than 1 inch (25 mm) from each edge and no more
than 2 inches (51 mm) above the exposure line.

R905.8.7 Shake placement. The starter course at the eaves
shall be doubled and the bottom layer shall be either 15-inch
(381 mm), 18-inch (457 mm) or 24-inch (610 mm) wood
shakes or wood shingles. Fifteen-inch (381 mm) or 18-inch
(457 mm) wood shakes may be used for the final course at
the ridge. Shakes shall be interlaid with 18-inch-wide (457
mm) strips of not less than No. 30 felt shingled between
each course in such a manner that no felt is exposed to the
weather by positioning the lower edge of each felt strip
above the butt end of the shake it covers a distance equal to
twice the weather exposure.

TABLE RS05.8.6
WOOD SHAKE WEATHER EXPOSURE AND ROOF SLOPE

LENGTH | EXPOSURE (inches)

ROOFING MATERIAL (inches) | GRADE | 4:12 pitch or steeper
Shakes of naturally durable 18 No. 1 7
wood 24 | No.1 100
18 No. 1 7Y,
Preservative-treated taper 24 | No.1 10

sawn shakes of Southemn R

Yellow Pine 18 | No.2 5Y,
24 No. 2 7,
18 No. 1 7Y,
Taper-sawn shakes of 24 | No.1 10
naturally durable wood 18 No. 2 5,
24 No. 2 7Y,

For SI:  1inch=254mm.
a. For 24-inchby ¥,-inch handsplit shakes, the maximum exposure is 7'/, inches.

R905.8.8 Valley flashing. Roof valley flashing shall not be
less than No. 26 gage [0.019 inch (0.5 mm)] corrosion-resis-
tant sheet metal and shall extend atleast 11 inches (279 mm)
from the centerline each way. Sections of flashing shall have
an end lap of not less than 4 inches (102 mm).

R905.8.9 Label required. Each bundle of shakes shall be
identified by a label of an approved grading or inspection
bureau or agency.

R905.9 Built-up roofs. The installation of built-up roofs shall

comply with the provisions of this section.

2010 CALIFORNIA RESIDENTIAL CODE

ROCF ASSEMBLIES

R905.9.1 Slope. Built-up roofs shall have a design slope of
a minimum of one-fourth unit vertical in 12 units horizon-
tal (2-percent slope) for drainage, except for coal-tar
built-up roofs, which shall have a design slope of a mini-
mum one- eighth unit vertical in 12 units horizontal (1-per-
cent slope).

R905.9.2 Material standards. Built-up roof covering mate-
rials shall comply with the standards in Table R905.9.2.

R905.9.3 Application. Built-up roofs shall be installed
according to this chapter and the manufacturer’s installation
instructions.

R905.10 Metal roof panels. The installation of metal roof
panels shall comply with the provisions of this section.

R905.10.1 Deck requirements. Metal roof panel roof cov-
erings shall be applied to solid or spaced sheathing, except
where the roof covering is specifically designed to be
applied to spaced supports.

R905.10.2 Slope. Minimum slopes for metal roof panels
shall comply with the following:

1. The minimum slope for lapped, nonsoldered-seam
metal roofs without applied lap sealant shall be three
units vertical in 12 units horizontal (25-percent
slope).

2. The minimum slope for lapped, nonsoldered-seam
metal roofs with applied lap sealant shall be one-half
vertical unit in 12 units horizontal (4-percent slope).
Lap sealants shall be applied in accordance with the
approved manufacturer’s installation instructions.

3. The minimum slope for standing-seam roof systems
shall be one-quarter unit vertical in 12 units horizon-
tal (2-percent slope).

R905.10.3 Material standards. Metal-sheet roof covering
systems that incorporate supporting structural members
shall be designed in accordance with the California Build-
ing Code. Metal-sheet roof coverings installed over struc-
tural decking shall comply with Table R905.10.3(1). The
materials used for metal-sheet roof coverings shall be natu-
rally corrosion resistant or provided with corrosion resis-
tance in accordance with the standards and minimum
thicknesses shown in Table R905.10.3(2).

R905.10.4 Attachment. Metal roof panels shall be secured
to the supports in accordance with this chapter and the man-
ufacturer’s installation instructions. In the absence of manu-

facturer’s installation instructions, the following fasteners
shall be used:

1. Galvanized fasteners shall be used for steel roofs.

2. Copper, brass, bronze, copper alloy and Three hun-
dred series stainless steel fasteners shall be used for
copper roofs.

3. Stainless steel fasteners are acceptable for metal
roofs.

R905.10.5 Underlayment. Underlayment shall be installed
in accordance with the manufacturer’s installation instruc-
tions.

501




ROOF ASSEMBLIES

TABLE R905.9.2

BUILT-UP ROOFING MATERIAL STANDARDS

MATERIAL STANDARD STANDARD
Acrylic coatings used in roofing ASTM D 6083
Aggregate surfacing ASTM D 1863
Asphalt adhesive used in roofing ASTM D 3747
Asphalt cements used in roofing ASTM D 3019; D 2822; D 4586
Asphalt-coated glass fiber base sheet ASTM D 4601
Asphalt coatings used in roofing ASTM D 1227, D 2823; D 2824; D 4479
Asphalt glass felt ASTM D 2178
Asphalt primer used in roofing ASTM D 41
Asphalt-saturated and asphalt-coated organic felt base sheet ASTM D 2626
Asphalt-saturated organic felt (perforated) ASTM D 226
Asphalt used in roofing ASTM D 312
Coal-tar cements used in roofing ASTM D 4022; D 5643
Coal-tar primer used in roofing, dampproofing and waterproofing ASTM D 43
Coal-tar saturated organic felt ASTM D 227
Coal-tar used in roofing ASTM D 450, Types I or II
Glass mat, coal tar ASTM D 4990
Glass mat, venting type ASTM D 4897
Mineral-surfaced inorganic cap sheet ASTM D 3909
Thermoplastic fabrics used in roofing ASTM D 5665; D 5726

TABLE R905.10.3(1)

METAL ROOF COVERINGS STANDARDS

ROOF COVERING TYPE

STANDARD APPLICATION RATE/THICKNESS

Galvanized steel

ASTM A 653 G90 Zinc coated

Stainless steel

ASTM A 240, 300 Series alloys

Steel

ASTM A 924

Lead-coated copper

ASTMB 101

ASTM B 370 mlmmum 16 oz/square ft and 12 oz/square ft high yield copper for

Cold rolled copper
) metal-sheet roof-covering systems; 12 oz/square ft for preformed metal shingle
systems.
Hard lead 2 Ib/sq ft
Soft lead 3 1b/sq ft
Alumi ASTM B 209, 0,024 minimum thickness for roliformed panels and 0.019 inch
uminum

minimum thickness for pressformed shingles.

Terne (tin) and terne-coated stainless

Terne coating of 40 Ib per double base box, field painted where applicable in
accordance with manufacturer’s installation instructions.

Zinc

0.027 inch minimum thickness: 99.995% electrolytic high grade zinc with alloy
additives of copper (0.08 - 0.20%), titanium (0.07% - 0.12%) and aluminum
(0.015%).

For SI: 1 ounce per square foot = 0.305 kg/m?, 1 pound per square foot = 4.214 kg/n?, 1 inch = 25.4 mm, 1 pound = 0.454 kg.

502

2010 CALIFORNIA RESIDENTIAL CODE




TABLE R905.10.3(2)
. MINIMUM CORROSION RESISTANCE

55% aluminum-zinc alloy
coated steel

5% aluminum alloy-coated steel | ASTM A 875 GF60

ASTM A 792 AZ 50

ROCF ASSEMBLIES

R905.13.2 Material standards. Thermoplastic single-ply
roof coverings shall comply with ASTM D 4434, ASTM D
6754, ASTM D 6878, or CGSB CAN/CGSB 37.54.

R905.13.3 Application. Thermoplastic single-ply roofs
shall be installed according to this chapter and the manufac-

Aluminum-coated steel ASTM A 463 T2 65 turer’s installation instructions.
Galvanized steel ASTM A 653 G-90 R905.14 Sprayed polyurethane foam roofing. The installa-
Prepainted steel ASTM A 7552 tion of sprayed polyurethane foam roofing shall comply with

the provisions of this section.

a. Paint systems in accordance with ASTM A 755 shall be applied over steel
products with corrosion-resistant coatings complying with ASTM A 792,
ASTM A 875, ASTM A 463, or ASTM A 653. }

R905.11 Modified bitumen roofing. The installation of modified

bitumen roofing shall comply with the provisions of this section.

R905.11.1 Slope. Modified bitumen membrane roofs shall
have a design slope of a minimum of one~fourth unit vertical
in 12 units horizontal (2-percent slope) for drainage.

R905.11.2 Material standards. Modified bitumen roof
coverings shall comply with the standards in Table

R905.14.1 Slope. Sprayed polyurethane foam roofs shall
have a design slope of a minimum of one-fourth unit vertical
in 12 units horizontal (2-percent slope) for drainage.

RY905.14.2 Material standards. Spray-applied polyure-
thane foam insulation shall comply with ASTM C 1029,
Type I or IV.

R905.14.3 Application. Foamed-in-place roof insulation
shall be installed in accordance with this chapter and the
manufacturer’s installation instructions. A liquid-applied
protective coating that complies with Section R905.15 shall

R905.11.2. be applied no less—than 2 hours nor more than 72 hours fol-
TABLE R905.11.2 lowing the application of the foam.
MODIFIED BITUMEN ROOFING MATER!IAL STANDARDS R905.14.4 Foam plastics. Foam plastic materials and
MATERIAL STANDARD : installation shall comply with Section R316.
Acrylic coating ASTM D 6083 R905.15 Liquid-applied coatings. The installation of liquid-
Asphalt adhesive ASTM D 3747 applied coatings shall comply with the provisions of this section.
Asphalt cement ASTM D 3019 _ R905.15.1 Slope. Liql;id—apgli;rthdroofs shall helwe ai gesign
. slope of a minimum of one-fo unit vertical in 12 units
Asphalt coating ASTM D 1227, D 2824 ho rpizontal (2-percent slope).
Asphalt primer ASTMD 41 R905.15.2 Material standards. Liquid-applied roof coat-
P ASTM D 6162; D 6163; D 6164; ings shall comply with ASTM C 836, C 957, D 1227, D
Modified bitumen 100f | 6292: D 6223; D 6298; 3468, D 6083, D 6694 or D 6947.
CGSB 37-GP-56M
R905.15.3 Application. Liquid-applied roof coatings shall
R905.11.3 Application. Modified bitumen roofs shall be be installed according to this chapter and the manufacturer’s
installed according to this chapter and the manufacturer’s installation instructions.
installation instructions.
R905.12 Thermoset single-ply roofing. The installation of SECTION RS06
thermoset single-ply roofing shall comply with the provisions ROOE INSULATION

of this section. R906.1 General. The use of above-deck thermal insulation

R905.12.1 Slope. Thermoset single-ply membrane roofs shall be permitted provided such insulation is covered with an
shall have a design slope of a minimum of one-fourth unit approved roof covering and passes FIM 4450 or UL 1256.
vertical in 12 units horizontal (2-percent slope) for drainage. R906.2 Material standards. Above-deck thermal insulation
R905.12.2 Material standards. Thermoset single-ply roof ~ board shall comply with the standards in Table R906.2.

coverings shall comply with ASTM D 4637, ASTM D 5019 TABLE R906.2

or CGSB 37-GP-52M. MATERIAL STANDARDS FOR ROOF INSULATION
R905.12.3 Application. Thermoset single-ply roofs shall Cellular glass board ASTM C 552

be installed according to this chapter and the manufacturer’s Composite boards ASTM C 1289, Type IIL, IV, V or VI

installation instructions. -
Expanded polystyrene . |ASTM C 578

Extruded polystyrene board | ASTM C 578

R905.13 Thermoplastic single-ply roofing. The installation
of thermoplastic single-ply roofing shall comply with the pro-

visions of this section. Perlite board ASTM C 728
R905.13.1 Slope. Thermoplastic single-ply membrane Polyisocyanurate board ASTM C 1289, Type I or Type I
roofs shall have a design slope of a minimum of one-fourth Wood fiberboard ASTM C 208

_unit vertical in 12 units horizontal (2-percent slope).

2010 CALIFORNIA RESIDENTIAL CODE 503



ROOF ASSEMBLIES

SECTION RS07
REROOFING

R907.1 General. Materials and methods of application used
for re-covering or replacing an existing roof covering shall
comply with the requirements of Chapter 9.

Exception: Reroofing shall not be required to meet the min-
imum design slope requirement of one-quarter unit vertical
in 12 units horizontal (2-percent slope) in Section R905 for
roofs that provide positive roof drainage.

R907.2 Structural and construction loads. The structural
roof components shall be capable of supporting the roof cover-
ing system and the material and equipment loads that will be
encountered during installation of the roof covering system.

R907.3 Recovering versus replacement. New roof coverings
shall not be installed without first removing all existing layers
of roof coverings where any of the following conditions exist:

1. Where the existing roof or roof covering is water-soaked
or has deteriorated to the point that the existing roof or
roof covering is not adequate as a base for additional
roofing.

2. Where the existing roof covering is wood shake, slate,
clay, cement or asbestos-cement tile.

3. Where the existing roof has two or more applications of
any type of roof covering.

4. For asphalt shingles, when the building is located in an
area subject to moderate or severe hail exposure accord-
ing to Figure R903.5.

Exceptions:

1. Complete and separate roofing systems, such as
standing-seam metal roof systems, that are designed
to transmit the roof loads directly to the building’s
structural system and that do not rely on existing roofs
and roof coverings for support, shall not require the
removal of existing roof coverings.

2. Installation of metal panel, metal shingle and concrete
and clay tile roof coverings over existing wood shake
roofs shall be permitted when the application is in
accordance with Section R907.4.

3. The application of new protective coating over exist-
ing spray polyurethane foam roofing systems shall be
permitted without tear-off of existing roof coverings.

504

R907.4 Roof recovering. Where the application of a new roof
covering over wood shingle or shake roofs creates a combusti-
ble concealed space, the entire existing surface shall be covered
with gypsum board, mineral fiber, glass fiber or other approved
materials securely fastened in place.

R907.5 Reinstallation of materials. Existing slate, clay or
cement tile shall be permitted for reinstallation, except that
damaged, cracked or broken slate or tile shall not be reinstalled.
Existing vent flashing, metal edgings, drain outlets, collars and
metal counterflashings shall not be reinstalled where rusted,
damaged or deteriorated. Aggregate surfacing materials shall
not be reinstalled.

R907.6 Flashings. Flashings shall be reconstructed in accor-
dance with approved manufacturer’s installation instructions.
Metal flashing to which bituminous materials are to be adhered
shall be primed prior to installation.

2010 CALIFORNIA RESIDENTIAL CODE



BUILDING PLANNING

SECTION R314
SMOKE ALARMS

R314.1 Smoke detection and notification. All smoke alarms
shall be listed in accordance with UL 217 and installed in
accordance with the provisions of this code and the household
fire warning equipment provisions of NFPA 72. Systems and
components shall be California State Five Marshal listed and
approved in accordance with California Code of Regulations,
Title 19, Division 1 for the purpose for which they are installed.

R314.2 Smoke detection systems. Household fire alarm sys-
tems installed in accordance with NFPA 72 that include
smoke alarms’, or a combination of smoke detector and audi-
ble notification device installed as required by this section for
smoke alarms, shall be permitted. The household fire alarm
system shall provide the same level of smoke detection and
alarm as required by this section for smoke alarms. Where a
household fire warning system is installed using a combina-
tion of smoke detector and audible notification device(s), it
shall become a permanent fixture of the occupancy and
owned by the homeowner. The system shall be monitored by
an approved supervising station and be mamtamed in accor-
dance with NFPA 72.

Exception: Where smoke alarms are provided meeting the
requirements of Section R314.4,

R314.3 Location. Smoke alarms shall be installed in the fol-
lowing locations:

1. In each sleeping room.

2. Outside each separate sleeping area in the immediate
vicinity of the bedrooms.

3. Oneach additional sfory of the dwelling, including base-
ments and habitable attics but not including crawl spaces
and uninhabitable attics. In dwellings or dwelling units
with split levels and without an intervening door
between the adjacent levels, a smoke alarm installed on
the upper level shall suffice for the adjacent lower level
provided that the lower level is less than one full story
below the upper level.

When more than one smoke alarm is required to be installed
within an individual dwelling unit the alarm devices shall be
interconnected in such a manner that the actuation of one alarm
will activate all of the alarms in the individual unit.

R314.3.1 Alterations, repairs and additions. When alter-
ations, repairs or additions requiring a permit occut, or
when one or more sleeping rooms are added or created in
existing dwellings, the individual dwelling unit shall be
equipped with smoke alarms located as required for new
dwellings.

Exceptions: See Section R314.6.°

R314.4 Power source. Smoke alarms shall receive their pri-
mary power from the building wiring provided that such wiring
is served from a commercial source and shall be equipped with
a battery backup. Smoke alarms with integral strobes that are
not equipped with battery backup shall be connected to an
emergency electrical system. Smoke alarms shall emit a signal

when the batteries are low. Wiring shall be permanent and

94

without a disconnecting switch other than as required for
overcurrent protection.

Exceptions:

1. Smoke alarms are permitted to be solely battery oper-
ated in existing buildings where no construction is
taking place.

2. Smoke alarms.are permitted to be solely battery oper-
ated in buildings that are not served from a commer-
.cial power source.

3. Smoke alarms are permitted to be solely battery oper-
ated in existing areas of buildings undergoing alter-
ations or repairs that do not result in the removal of
interior walls or ceiling finishes exposing the struc-
ture, unless there is an attic, crawl space or basement
available which could provide access for building
wiring without the removal of interior finishes.

R314.5 Interconnection. Where more than one smoke alarm is
required to be installed within an individual dwelling or sleep-
ing unit, the smoke alarms shall be interconnected in such a
manner that the activation of one alarm will activate all of the
alarms in the individual unit. The alarm shall be clearly audi-
ble in all bedrooms over background noise levels with all inter-
vening doors closed

Exceptions:

1. Interconnection is not required in buildings that are
not undergoing alterations, repairs or construction of
any kind.

2. Smoke alarms in existing areas are not required to be
interconnected where alterations or repairs do not
result in the removal of interior wall or ceiling fin-
ishes exposing the structure, unless there is an attic,
crawl space or basement available which could pro-
vide access for interconnection without the removal
of interior finishes.

R314.6 Existing Group R-3 occupancies,

R314.6.1 Existing buildings housing Group R-3 occupan-
cies established prior to the effective date of these regula-
tions may have their use continued if they conform or are
made to' conform to provisions of these regulations to the
-extent that reasonable and adequate life safety against the
hazards of fire, panic and explosion is substantially pro-
vided. Additional means of egress, the installation of auto-
matic sprinkler systems, automatic fire alarm system or
other life safety measures may be required to provide rea-
sonable and adequate safety.

Note: It is the intent of this section that every existing
occupancy need not mandatorily conform with the
requirements for new construction. Reasonable judg-

ment in the application of requirements must be exer-

cised by the enforcing agency.

R314.6.2 For purposes of clarification, Health and Safety
Code Section 13113.7 is vepeated.

a. Exceptas otherwise provided in this section, a smoke
detector, approved and listed by the State Fire Mar-
shal pursuant to Section 13114, shall be installed, in

2010 CALIFORNIA RESIDENTIAL CODE




e
a0

accordance with the manufacturer’s instructions in
each dwelling intended for human occupancy within
the earliest applicable time period as follovws:

1. Forall dwelling units intended for human occu-
pancy, upon the owner’s application on or after
January 1, 19835, for a permit for alterations,
repairs, or additions, exceeding one thousand
dollars ($1,000). ‘

2. For all other dwelling units intended for human
occupancy on or after January 1, 1987.

However, if any local rule, regulation, or
ordinance, adopted prior to the compliance
dates specified in paragraphs (1).and (2)
requires installation in a dwelling unit intended
for human occupancy of smoke detector, which
receive their power from the electrical system
of the building and requires compliance with
the local rule, regulation, or ordinance at a
date subsequent to the dates specified in this
section, the compliance date specified in the
rule, regulation, or ordinance shall, but only
with respect to the dwelling units specified in
this section, take precedence over the dates
specified in this section.

The State Fire Marshal may adopt regula-
tions exempting dwellings intended for human
occupancy with fire sprinkler systems from the
provisions of this section, if he or she deter-
mines that a smoke detector is not reasonably
necessary for fire safety in.the occupancy.

Unless prohibited by local rules, regulations,
or ordinances, a battery-operated smoke detec-
tor which otherwise meets the standards
adopted pursuant to Section 13114 for smoke
detectors, satisfies the requirenients of this sec-
tion. '

b. “Dwelling units intended for human occupancy,” as

used in this section, includes a duplex, lodging house,
apartment complex, hotel, motel, condominium, stock
cooperative, time-share project, or dwelling unit ofa

multiple-unit dwelling complex. For the purpose of

this part, “dwelling units intended for human occu-
pancy” does not include manufactured homes as
defined in Section 18007, mobile homes as defined in

BUILDING PLANNING

d. A high-rise structure, as defined in subdivision (b) of

Section 13210 and regulated by Chapter 3 (com-
mencing with Section 13210), and which is used for
purposes other than as dwelling units intended for
human occupancy, is exempt from the requirements
of this section.

. The owner shall be responsible for testing and main-

taining detectors in hotels, motels, lodging houses,
and common stairwells of apartment complexes and
other multiple-dwelling complexes.

An owner or the owner’s agent may enter amny
dwelling unit, efficiency dwelling unit, guest room,
and suite owned by the owner for the purpose of
installing, repairing, testing, and maintaining single
station smoke detectors required by this section.
Except in cases of emergency, the owner or owner’s
agent shall give the tenants of each such unit, room,
or suite reasonable notice in writing of the intention
to enter and shall enter only during normal business
hours. Twenty-four hours shall be presumed to be
reasonable notice in absence of evidence to the con-
trary.

The smoke detector shall be operable at the time
that the tenant takes possession. The apartment com-
plex tenant shall be responsible for notifying the man-
ager or owner if the tenant becomes aware of an
inoperable smoke detector within his or her unit. The
owner or authorized agent shall correct any reported

deficiencies in the smoke detector and shall not be in

violation of this section for a deficient smoke detector
when he or she has not received notice of the defi-
ciency.

A violation of this section is an infraction punishable

by a maximum fine of two hundred dollars ($200) for
each offense.

. This section shall not affect any rights which the par-

ties may have under any other provision of law

-because of the presence or absence of a smoke detec-

tor.

. This section shall not apply to the installation of

smoke detectors in single-family dwellings or fac-
tory-built housing which is regulated by Section
13113.8, as added by Assembly Bill No. 2285 of the
1983-84 Regular Session.

R314.6.3 For purposes of clarification, Health and Safety
Code Section 13113.8 is repeated.

‘ Section 18008, and commercial coaches as deﬁhed in
B Section 18001.8.

¢. The owner ofeach dwelling unit subject to this sectioﬁ a. On and after January 1, 1986, every single- family

shall supply and install smoke detectors required by
this section in the locations and in the manner set
forth in the manufacturer’s instructions, as approved
by the State Fire Marshal’s regulations. In the case of
apartment complexes and other multiple-dwelling
complexes, a smoke detector shall be installed in the
common stairwells. All fire alarm warning systems
supplemental to the smoke detector shall also be
listed by the State Fire Marshal.

2010 CALIFORNIA RESIDENTIAL CODE

dwelling and factory-built housing, as defined in Sec-
tion 19971, which is sold shall have an operable
smoke detector. The detector shall be approved and
listed by the State Fire Marshal and installed in
accordance with the State Fire Marshal’s regula-
tions. Unless prohibited by local rules, regulations,
or ordinances, a battery-operated smoke detector
shall be deemed to satisfy the requirements of this sec-
tion.

95




BUILBING PLANNING

96

b. On and after January 1, 1986, the transferor of any

real property containing a single-family dwelling, as
described in subdivision (a), whether the transfer is
made by sale, exchange, or real property sales con-
tract, as defined in Section 2985 of the Civil Code,
shall deliver to the transferee a written statement
indicating that the transferor is in compliance with
this section. The disclosure statement shall be either
included in the receipt for deposit in a real estate
transaction, an addendum attached thereto, or a sep-
arate document.

. The transferor shall deliver the statement referred to

in subdivision (b) as soon as practicable before the
transfer of title in the case of a sale or exchange, or
Dpriorto execution of the contract where the transfer is
by a real property sales contract, as defined in Sec-
tion 2985. For purposes of this subdivision, “deliv-
ery” means delivery in person or by mail to the
transferee or transferor, or to any person authorized
to act for him or her in the transaction, or to addi-
tional transferees who have requested delivery from
the transferor in writing. Delivery to the spouse of a
transferee or transferor shall be deemed delivery to a
transferee or transferor, unless the contract states
otherwise.

d. This section does not apply to any of the following:

1. Transfers which are required to be preceded by
the furnishing to a prospective transferee of a
copy of a public report pursuant to Section
11018.1 of the Business and Professions Code.

2. Transfers pursuant to court order, including,
but not limited to, transfers ordered by a pro-
bate court in the administration of an estate,
transfers pursuant to a writ of execution, trans-
fers by a trustee in bankruptcy, transfers by
eminent domain, or transfers resulting from a
decree for specific performance.

3. Transfers to a mortgagee by a mortgagor in
default, transfers to a beneficiary of a deed of
trust by a trustor in default, transfers by any
Joreclosure sale after default, transfers by any
Joreclosure sale after default in an obligation
secured by a mortgage, or transfers by a sale
under a power of sale after a default in an obli-
gation secured by a deed of trust or secured by
any other instrument containing a power of
sale.

4. Transfers by a fiduciary in the course of the
administration of a decedent’s estate, guard-
ianship, conservatorship, or trust.

5. Transfers from one co-owner to one or more
CO-OWners.

6. Transfers made to a spouse, or to a person or
persons in the lineal line of consanguinity of
one or more of the transferors.

7. Transfers between spouses resulting from a
decree of dissolution of a marriage, from a

decree of legal separation, or from a property
settlement agreement incidental to either of
those decrees.

8. Transfers by the Controller in the course of
administering the Unclaimed Property Law
provided for in Chapter 7 (commencing with
Section 1500) of Title 10 of Part 3 of the Code of
Civil Procedure.

9. Transfers under the provisions of Chapter 7
(commencing with Section 3691) or Chapter 8
(commencing with Section 3771) of Part 6 of
Division I of the Revenue and Taxation Code.

e. No ligbility shall arise, nor any action be brought or

maintained against, any agent of any party to a trans-
fer of title, including any person or entity acting in the
capacity of an escrow, for any error, inaccuracy, or
omission relating to the disclosure required to be
made by a transferor pursuant to this section. How-
ever, this subdivision does not apply to a licensee, as
defined in Section 10011 of the Business and Profes-
sions Code, where the licensee participates in the
making of the disclosure required to be made pursu-
ant to this section with actual knowledge of the falsity
of the disclosure. '

. Except as otherwise provided in this section, this sec-

tion shall not be deemed to create or imply a duty
upon a licensee, as defined in Section 10011 of the
Business and Professions Code, or upon any agent of
any party to a transfer of title, including any person or
entity acting in the capacity of an escrow, to monitor
or ensure compliance with this section.

. No transfer of title shall be invalidated on the basis of

a failure to comply with this section, and the exclusive
remedy for the failure to comply with this section is an
award of actual damages not to exceed one hundred
dollars ($100), exclusive of any court costs and attor-
ney’s fees.

. Local ordinances requiring smoke detectors in sin-

gle-family dwellings may be enacted or amended.
However, the ordinances shall satisfy the minimum
requirements of this section.

. Forthepurposes of this section, “single-family dwell-

ing” does not include a manufactured home as

.defined in Section 18007, a mobilehome as defined in

Section 18008, or a commercial coach as defined in
Section 18001.8.

This section shall not apply to the installation of
smoke detectors in dwellings intended for human
occupancy, as defined in and regulated by Section
13113.7 of the Health and Safety Code, as added by
Senate Bill No. 1448 in the 1983-84 Regular Session.

SECTION R315
CARBON MONOXIDE ALARMS

R315.1 Carbon monoxide alarms. For new construction, an
approved carbon monoxide alarm shall be installed in dwelling

2010 CALIFORNIA RESIDENTIAL CODE




units and in sleeping units within which fuel-burning appli-
ances are installed and in dwelling units that have attached
garages. :

R315.1.1 Power supply. For new construction required car-
bon monoxide alarms shall receive their primary power
from the building wiring where such wiring is served from a
commercial source and shall be equipped with a battery
back-up. Alarm wiring shall be directly connected to the
permanent building wiring without a disconnecting switch
other than as required for overcurrent protection.

Exceptions.;

1. In dwelling units where there is no commercial
power supply the carbon monoxide alarm may be
solely battery operated.

2. In existing dwelling units a carbon monoxide
* glarm is permitted to be solely battery operated
where repairs or alterations do not result in the
removal of wall and ceiling finishes or there is no
access by means of attic, basement or crawl space.

R315.1.2 Interconnection. Where more than one carbon
monoxide alarm is required to be installed within the dwell-
ing unit or within a sleeping unit the alarm shall be inter-
connected in a manner that activation of one alarm shall
activate all of the alarms in the individual unit.

Exception:

1. Interconnection is not required in existing dwell-
ing units where repairs do not result in the removal
of wall and ceiling finishes, there is no access by
means of attic, basement or crawl space, and no
previous method for interconnection existed.

R315.2 Where required in existing dwellings. Where a per-
mit is required for alterations, repairs or additions exceeding
one thousand dollars ($1,000), existing dwellings or sleeping
units that have attached garages or fuel-burning appliances

‘shall be provided with a carbon monoxide alarm in accordance

with Section R315.1. Carbon monoxide alarms shall only be
required in the specific dwelling unit or sleeping unit for which
the permit was obtained. :

R315.3 Alarm requirements. Single- and multiple-station
carbon monoxide alarms shall be listed as complying with the
requirements of UL 2034. Carbon monoxide detectors shall be
listed as complying with the requirements of UL 2075. Carbon
monoxide alarms and carbon monoxide detectors shall be
installed in accordance with this code, the current edition of
NFPA 720 “Standard for the Installation of Carbon Monoxide
(CO) Detection and Warning Equipment” and the manufac-
turer’s installation instructions. Other carbon monoxide alarm
and detection devices as recognized in NFPA 720 are also
acceptable.

Carbon monoxide alarms required by Sections R31 5.1 and
R315.2 shall be installed in the following locations:

1. Outside of each separate dwelling unit sleeping area in
the immediate vicinity of the bedroom(s).

2. On every level of a dwelling unit including basements.

2010 CALIFORNIA RESIDENTIAL CODE

BUILDING PLANNING

R315.3.1 Multiple-purpose alarms. Carbon monoxide
alarms combined with smoke alarms shall comply with Sec-
tion R315, all applicable standards, and requirements for
listing and approval by the Office of the State Fire Marshal,
for smoke alarms.

SECTION R316
FOAM PLASTIC

R316.1 General. The provisions of this section shall govern
the materials, design, application, construction and installation
of foam plastic materials.

R316.2 Labeling and identification. Packages and contain-
ers of foam plastic insulation and foam plastic insulation
components delivered to the job site shall bear the label of an
approved agency showing the manufacturer’s name, the prod-
uct listing, product identification and information sufficient
to determine that the end use will comply with the require-
ments.

R316.3 Surface burning characteristics. Unless otherwise
allowed in Section R316.5 or R316.6, all foam plastic or foam
plastic cores used as a component in manufactured assemblies
used in building construction shall have a flame spread index of
not more than 75 and shall have a smoke-developed index of
not more .than 450 when tested in the maximum thickness
intended for use in accordance with ASTM E 84 or UL 723.
Loose-fill type foam plastic insulation shall be tested as board
stock for the flame spread index and smoke-developed index.

Exception: Foam plasticinsulation more than 4 inches (102
mm) thick shall have a maximum flame spread index of 75
and a smoke-developed index of 450 where tested at a mini-
mum thickness of 4 inches (102 mm), provided the end use
is approved in accordance with Section R316.6 using the
thickness and density intended for use.

R316.4 Thermal barrier. Unless otherwise allowed in Section
R316.5 or Section R316.6, foam plastic shall be separated from
the interior of a building by an approved thermal barrier of min-
imum Y, inch (12.7 mm) gypsum wallboard or an approved fin-
ish material equivalent to a thermal barrier material that will

~ limit the average temperature rise of the unexposed surface to

no more than 250°F (139°C) after 15 minutes of fire exposure
complying with the ASTME 119 or UL 263 standard time tem-
perature curve. The thermal barrier shall be installed in such a
manner that it will remain in place for 15 minutes based on
NFPA 286 with the acceptance criteria of Section R302.9.4,
FM 4880, UL 1040 or UL 1715.

R316.5 Specific requirements. The following requirements
shall apply to these uses of foam plastic unless specifically
approved in accordance with Section R316.6 or by other sec-
tions of the code or the requirements of Sections R316.2
through R316.4 have been met.

R316.5.1 Masonry or concrete construction. The thermal
barrier specified in Section R316.4 is not required in a
masonry or concrete wall, floor or roof when the foam plas-
tic insulation is separated from the interior of the building
by aminimum 1-inch (25 mm) thickness of masonry or con- -
crete.

97




MATERIALS AND CONSTRUCTION METHODS FOR EXTERIOR WILDFIRE EXPOSURE

SECTION 705A
ROOFING

705A.1 General. Roofs shall comply with the requirements of
Chapter 7A and Chapter 15. Roofs shall have a roofing assem-
bly installed in accordance with its listing and the manufac-
turer’s installation instructions.

705A.2 Roof coverings. Where the roof profile allows a space
between the roof covering and roof decking, the spaces shall be
constructed to prevent the intrusion of flames and embers, be
firestopped with approved materials or have one layer of mini-
mum 72 pound (32.4 kg) mineral-surfaced nonperforated cap
sheet complying with ASTM D 3909 installed over the combus-
tible decking.

705A.3 Roof valleys. Where valley flashing is installed, the
flashing shall be not less than 0.019-inch (0.48 mm) No. 26
gage galvanized sheet corrosion-resistant metal installed over
not less than one layer of minimum 72 pound (32.4 kg) min-
eral-surfaced nonperforated cap sheet complying with ASTM
D 3909, at least 36-inch-wide (914 mm) running the full length
of the valley.

705A.4 Roof gutters. Roof gutters shall be provided with the
means to prevent the accumulation of leaves and debris in the
guiter.

SECTION 706A
VENTS

706A.1 General. Where provided, ventilation openings for
enclosed attics, enclosed eave soffit spaces, enclosed rafter
spaces formed where ceilings are applied directly to the under-
side of roof rafters, and underfloor ventilation shall be in
accordance with Section 1203 and Sections 7006A.1 through
706A.3 to resist building ignition from the intrusion of burning
embers and flame through the ventilation openings.

706A.2 Requirements. Ventilation openings for enclosed
attics, enclosed eave soffit spaces, enclosed rafter spaces
Sformed where ceilings are applied directly to the underside of
roof rafters, and underfloor ventilation openings shall be fully
covered with metal wire mesh, vents, other materials or other
devices that meet the following requirements:

1. The dimensions of the openings therein shall be a mini-
mum of /,g-inch (1.6 mm) and shall not exceed '/s-inch
(3.2mm).

2. The materials used shall be noncombustible.

Exception: Vents located under the roof covering,
along the ridge of roofs, with the exposed surface of
the vent covered by noncombustible wire mesh, may
be of combustible materials.

3. The materials used shall be corrosion resistant.

706A.3 Ventilation openings on the underside of eaves and
cornices: Vents shall not be installed on the underside of eaves
and cornices.

Exceptions:

1. The enforcing agency may accept or approve special
eave and cornice vents that resist the intrusion of
flame and burning embers.

258

2. Vents complying with the requirements of Section
706A.2 may be installed on the underside of eaves and
cornices in accordance with either one of the follow-
ing conditions:

2.1. The attic space being ventilated is fully pro-
tected by an automatic sprinkler system in-
stalled in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1
or,

2.2. The exterior wall covering and exposed un-
derside of the eave are of noncombustible ma-
terial, or ignition-resistant-materials as
determined in accordance with SFM Stan-
dard 12-7A-5 Ignition-Resistant Material and
the vent is located more than 12 feet from the
ground or walking surface of a deck, porch,
patio or similar surface.

SECTION 707A
EXTERIOR COVERING

707A.1 Scope. The provisions of this section shall govern the
materials and construction methods used to resist building
ignition and/or safeguard against the intrusion of flames
resulting from small ember and short-term direct flame contact
exposure.

707A.2 General. The following exterior covering materials
and/or assemblies shall comply with this section:

1. Exterior wall covering material

. Exterior wall assembly

. Exterior exposed underside of roof eave overhangs
. Exterior exposed underside of roof eave soffits
Exposed underside of exterior porch ceilings

Exterior exposed underside of floor projections

NS LA W

. Exterior underfloor areas
Exceptions:

1. Exterior wall architectural trim, embellishments, fas-
cias, and gutters

2. Roof or wadll top cornice projections and similar
assemblies

3. Roof assembly projections over gable end walls

4. Solid wood rafter tails and solid wood blocking
installed between rafters having minimum dimension
2 inch (50.8 mm) nominal

'5. Deck walking surfaces shall comply with Section
709A.4 only

707A.3 Exterior walls. The exterior wall covering or wall
assembly shall comply with one of the following requirements:

1. Noncombustible material
2. Ignition-resistant material
3. Heavy timber exterior wall assembly

4. Log wall construction assembly

2010 CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE




